I Ho Sto WeA0-33004/99 REGD. NO. D. L.-33004/99

US4

WA TR

d ShT
CThe Gazette of India

EXTRAORDINARY
AT I[I—9Us 3—3U-9Us (i)
PART II—Section 3—Sub-section (i)
IR | TehTioTe
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

|, 480] 73 faoett, qear, @R 29, 2015/950E0 7, 1937
No. 480] NEW DELHI, WEDNESDAY, JULY 29, 2015/SHRAVANA 7, 1937

[ HATH
st
7% faeett, 28 F=TE, 2015

T, 594(3r).—vsTTar [T AfAH=w, 1966 (1966 =T 31) FT &7 87 FIXT Ta< ThAl T TANT FLT
§U, FET HTH UAEgRT SSNE 89 TS e # fAwferiea sneradi F seadfia, dora qeq afdqa FwT (dre
Herre) stfafaas, 2011 (AT 2011 FT o1 ATAHTT 5.26) AT fSearia et §, SaTis 26 TTEg=aT & Threrd i
JIE &l G179 5T | 99 &, AATC—
e
1. T 1 HF IT-GT (1) H, o @ ateq FT (e gerge) stfefaas, 20117 qFa@T, Fesi ud dai
1T “HASNIE § T 47 H 747 BHaia’ a9z dqgaiud R s
2. 4TI 2 &7 AT AT Susm
3. 9T 4 FT g FBRAT S
4. oTT 6 FT AT AT ST
FIA[TH
YorTe Yo afda < (e gavae) afdfgw, 2011

(@F 2011 F7 T STTAIH T.26)
1. GfRIqE T UF WRW.—(1) = Stefaas 7 dsia qo@ afdq w2 (e geara) sfafaas, 2011 F=zr s
(2) T TLHTA TATAT 20T

2. 99 2005 ¥ dere aAfAfAaw 8 F gy 6 ¥ Heaa.—dsi1a goF afda w2 srfafaaw, 2005 (I T9F a8 qA
afgfw & w9 § f[Afaye) #, om0 6 #, I7-917 6 F are MuAferiad IT-amard [Tt ot sraidq—

3272 GI/2015 (1)



2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART IT—SEC. 3(i)]

“(7) IT-gTT (1) & IT-=T (6) T ® FAfga et ara & gra gu ff, To@ o uH a7, s Faita
T ST quT sfefea it ST aTet aEget F AT 9% UHT & 9, S steea A S, g S
At % siania Ve aeqel 9% @] 320 & AT 7 I, AR T § FT aGqA FHA1|

i 7 T T A fasft 3 forg = fasfy % forw et =g & Rrfmtor a7 seeeweor & soerm % i 2

g A ag At 6 TR = # suied UE FT A TOET Iq@E T Aatd F oiq | H ANF AT 0l AT
AR F ®Y H FT JTUIAT

(8) AT & | FFA F TA Haeft dsira T sAfafta=w, 2000 (FF 2000 F7 Go1ar ATAAH €.9) F siavia
HURT T IT-ATT (7) F ITFLTAT 6 T T HIAT SITUAT|”

3. 99 2005 ¥ gerre srfafAaw 8 # gy 8 | Heaw.— srfafaw &, gy 8 #, IT-4T (1) H, T H, “A%
sfcrerd AT ArEEl w1 A AT ST
4. a¥ 2005 F goe AfAFHEw 8 F g 13 F Weaw.—= Afg=aw #, gwr 13 #, IT-amT (1) F a5,
feeferfaT ST-eme i Fgamfua it STustt, sraia-
“(1-%) g7 6 T IT-GTT (7) F AT ATUH T H HULT Y Hl, SIS FL H(Se 6 &7 § FHT SATCAT”|
5. a4 2005 ¥ gysre FfafAaw 8 it ar 62 ¥ "WeartgA.—q« AfafHaw #, gy 62 #, 3T-gmT (5) * forw,
eEferfaT S-emr sfasaroT it STosft, st
“(5) ot srdier w= aa @& =T €1 T STom, e 9% Ut orfter & | sfafied 9w, arfEd ud
FATS, AR TS T, Al T TCA 6 THATT (AT 6 TF AIATH SIIATT HT SIS THIOT 7 2l

HAETHF — TH IT-GTT o SATSA1 6 forw, “dfafiega 7R & Fg a7 w2 afaq g S 39 dfafamw a7
=A% Fqua aare U et ar waE R w7 afataaw, 1956 (1956 #r sfafaas €.74) & fhel
It o srefie qriva fohet sraer % aRormaeEsy et T mr gn”

6. fFmw wd s9a.—(1) 95Ta ‘g F AT FT (T FATE) TR, 2011 (AT 2011 FT TS FLATIL H.9)
Y IS g afgd wT (FTAT HeATe) TeATRer, 2011 (AW 2011 F GSATE LA H. 10) FT TAGERT
IEREERERIRSIIE]

(2) TH F|T & arasE, g atetaay, 3u-amT (1) § e st g 79y genfa, % sava o T
foreft 1 =7 it 2 TRt Freare i g atataaw, 39 afefaay gy T gentd, F siavia AT @ w3 41
#FT TS FATS GTHT AT

[T, €. 7 11020/5/2014-7 ¥ U]

TreRer g, €T afea
MINISTRY OF HOME AFFAIRS
NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 28th July, 2015

G.S.R. 594(E).—In exercise of the powers conferred by section 87 of the Punjab Reorganization Act, 1966
(31 of 1966), the Central Government hereby extends to the Union territory of Chandigarh, the Punjab Value Added
Tax (Third Amendment) Act, 2011 (Punjab Act No.26 of 2011), as in force in the State of Punjab on the date of
publication of this notification, subject to the following modifications, namely:—

MODIFICATIONS

1. In sub-section (1) of section 1, after the words, brackets and figures “the Punjab Value Added Tax (Third
Amendment) Act, 2011, the words “as extended to the Union territory of Chandigarh™ shall be inserted.

2. Section 2 shall be omitted.
Section 4 shall be omitted.
4. Section 6 shall be omitted.



[9FT [I-T8 3 (i)] AT hl TSTIA @ STHEOT 3

ANNEXURE
THE PUNJAB VALUE ADDED TAX (THIRD AMENDMENT) ACT, 2011
(Punjab Act No.26 of 2011)

1. Short title and commencement.— (1) This Act may be called the Punjab Value Added Tax (Third
Amendment) Act, 2011.

(2) It shall come into force at once.

2.  Amendment of section 6 of Punjab Act 8 of 2005.—In the Punjab Value Added Tax Act, 2005 (hereinafter
referred to as the principal Act), in section 6, after sub-section (6), the following sub-sections shall be added,
namely:-

“(7) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (1) to sub-section(6), the State Government shall
charge the tax in advance on the import of goods to be notified in such manner, as may be prescribed, and
at such rates, as may be notified, but not exceeding the rates applicable on such goods under the Act:

Provided that such goods are meant for sale or use in manufacturing or processing of any goods for sale;

Provided further that such tax collected in advance, shall be counted towards final liability of the taxable
person at the end of each tax period.

(8) The tax collected under the Punjab Tax on Entry of Goods into Local Areas Act, 2000 (Punjab Act
No.9 of 2000), shall be deemed to have been collected under the provisions of sub-section (7).”

3. Amendment of section 8 of Punjab Act 8 of 2005.—In the principal Act, in section 8, in sub-section (1), in
the proviso, the words “four per cent or” shall be omitted.

4. Amendment of section 13 of Punjab Act 8 of 2005.—In the principal Act, in section 13, after sub-section (1),
the following sub-section shall be inserted, namely:-

29

“(1-A) The tax collected in advance under sub-section (7) of section 6, shall be treated as input tax credit.

5. Amendment of section 62 of Punjab Act 8 of 2005.—In the principal Act, in section 62, for sub-section
(5), the following sub-section shall be substituted, namely:-

“(5) No appeal shall be entertained, unless such appeal is accompanied by satisfactory proof of the
prior minimum payment of twenty-five per cent of the total amount of additional demand, penalty and
interest, if any.

Explanation- For the purposes of this sub-section “additional demand” means any tax imposed as a
result of any order passed under any of the provisions of this Act or the rules made there under or under
the Central Sales Tax Act, 1956 (Act No.74 of 1956)”.

6. Repeal and saving.—(1) The Punjab Value Added Tax (Third Amendment) Ordinance, 2011 (Punjab
Ordinance No.9 of 2011) and the Punjab Value Added Tax (Fourth Amendment) Ordinance, 2011 (Punjab
Ordinance No.10 of 2011), are hereby repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken under the principal act, as amended by
the Ordinances referred to in sub-section (1), shall be deemed to have been done or taken under the principal
Act, as amended by this Act.

[F. No. U-11020/5/2014-UTL]
RAKESH SINGH, Jt. Secy.

@
% Reah, 28 s, 2015
HLFLLIA. 595(37). T qAtea A==, 1966 (1966 FT 31) T 1T 87 FIT Taw ATThAT T TN FHd
T, Feald TR UASgT ASNE 99 57 &7 § fAvaforterd smeiteri & sTeqefie use gog afdd FT (JTAr deire)
Ffaf=m 2011 (AT 2011 FT U1 ATAHTH 7.27) 1 Bearid w2t 8, S97 % 280 ATEg==r % THee fF aera
T IS TS | TG |, AATT—



4 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART IT—SEC. 3(i)]

LT
1. o7 1 & IT-GT (1) ®, “O51a g7 afed w (Fr9T Ferred) Aferfa=e, 20117 9rsaf, Fesai UH il & a18
“HETE §F T o § 797 fAeariia” ores q et R oA
2. g 3 FT AT fHAr ST
IS
YorTe 4o aftra &< (St gere) sfafaew, 2011
@ 2011 7 oot St 7.27)
1. qfEreq AW TF TRA.—(1) =9 ATS==TT T G579 o qterd w (FTA7 derre) Ttaftaam, 2011 Fgr Ao
(2) Tg THTA TATAT BTN
2. T 2005 ¥ gorer AFATATT 8 Y AT 17 F WerEA. e go Afda w¥ arfeafaw, 2005 (F=T T@H
e g Atearf=aw % =7 # [Afdee) #, o7 17 F AiSEr 39699 o 3T I0-41T (1) F ®T § Fedifaha
TRIT SITUAT &Y 7 W qaeeitha ST-8meT (1) % a1g, MeAferifed S-gmd sia:emiod i Srusr
R
“(2) T FE T AT IV =FAT arfw S F sfraw fret g #r a7 frT Saeae i 3= S
g =71 stet 9w snfdw S % Faw awget #1 F e seae-gfHae e T ST 2, gt v
faforat it =2 g (Sfr-vee) gt el fosft ox oY =t grer 1 see e e 3w gt &7
Tiq AE T -3 (SI-1e) arelt faehl e arar s & JRF 2taq UHT faehl % 999 § 3 e
T IS o oTT qT gAT:
i 72 A % o giRe ar B Saerae i S g fasht ar i s gfRe FrEn, uH 9rEy b,
ST ferertfa fora ST, SHTor-as e w3 & AgF T Sr-1eE gl
3. Sgf -4 (2) # fAfde g gf[e =ier wres v fanht wdt €, F8f IT-amn(2) # fafafis sher-ves
[ElERIEISEEPEIDEEIRART
TICE R~
(i) erez “AfAe” I “FFaw ArfdF = F F@r O R0 S dura 7w snfIw s gt 2009 (39
2009 T vsiTa srferfe=s €.17) # = 9rsat & forw faw o g;
(ii) “=TAAIT” | FIE FTHT AT FATFAAT H1 e, BrEd Fuet, FF 97 Gewrd SURA ATH 8, AT g S
o srfere ST & A2 A7 QOF stEEe=ET 37 oed giaemo g, T, senfta, s=rfoa wwar
g, AT FTAT & T IAHT Taeld FLar g1”
3. 99 2005 ¥F gsire AfAfHgw 8 #it a1=r 27 & M. ATIHIH 7, &7=7 27 |, “F ATqerd” 57 AT Fal
AT §, dgt I o “at= afqera” erea sfaemiua o s

[FT. . T 11020/5/2014-7 &F U]
TreRer g, €T afea

NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 28th July, 2015

G.S.R. 595(E).—In exercise of the powers conferred by section 87 of the Punjab Reorganization Act, 1966
(31 of 1966), the Central Government hereby extends to the Union territory of Chandigarh, the Punjab Value Added
Tax (Fourth Amendment) Act, 2011, (Punjab Act No.27 of 2011), as in force in the State of Punjab on the date of
publication of this notification, subject to the following modifications, namely:-



[9FT [I-T8 3 (i)] AT hl TSTIA @ STHEOT 5

MODIFICATIONS

1. In sub-section (1) of Sectionl, after the words, brackets and figures “the Punjab Value Added Tax
(Fourth Amendment) Act, 20117, the words “as extended to the Union territory of Chandigarh” shall be
inserted.

2. Section 3 shall be omitted.
ANNEXURE
THE PUNJAB VALUE ADDED TAX (Fourth AMENDMENT) ACT, 2011
(Punjab Act No.27 of 2011)

1 Short title and commencement.—(1) This Act may be called the Punjab Value Added Tax Fourth
Amendment) Act, 2011.

(2) It shall come into force at once.

2. Amendment of section 17 of Punjab Act 8 of 2005.—In the Punjab Value Added Tax Act, 2005
(hereinafter referred to as the principal Act), the existing provision of section 17 shall be numbered as
sub-section (1) thereof and after sub-section (1) as so renumbered, the following sub-sections shall be
inserted, namely:-

“(2) Where any taxable goods are sold to a unit within the Special Economic Zone or to a developer
or where any inter-unit transaction of goods within the Special Economic Zone is made, such sales
shall be zero-rated. On such sale, no output tax is payable by any person:

Provided that a taxable person making zero-rated sale shall be eligible for input tax credit in
relation to such sale:

Provided further that the sale made to aforesaid unit or to a developer or an inter-unit
transaction shall be zero-rated subject to production of certificate in such form as may be
prescribed.

(3) Where any unit referred to in sub-section (2) makes sales directly to a customer, the provisions
of zero-rated sales specified in sub-section (2) shall not be applicable.

Explanation.- (1) The expressions “unit” and ‘“Special Economic Zone” shall have the same
meaning as has been assigned to these expressions in the Punjab Special
Economic Zone Act, 2009 (Punjab Act No. 17 of 2009);

(i1) “developer” means a person or a body of persons, including a company, a firm or a
Government undertaking, which establishes, constructs, installs, operates,
maintains or manages a part or whole of the infrastructure and other amenities in
the Special Economic Zone.”

3.  Amendment of section 27 of Punjab Act 8 of 2005.—In the principal Act, in section 27, for the words
“four per cent”, wherever occurring the words “five per cent” shall be substituted.

[F. No. U-11020/5/2014-UTL]
RAKESH SINGH, Jt. Secy.

sfrgaar
% faeett, 28 SIS, 2015
A1.HLLIA. 596(37).—dTa qAs ATA=TH, 1966 (1966 FT 31) T &TT 87 FIT Taw ATThAT T TN FHdT
TU, FR TN UAEgT ASRg 99 15 &7 § AuAferfad smenegsi & r=aefid osa §oq afegd F2 (Fere)
aferfaem; 2013 (I 2013 FT U1 ATAHIH 7.28) F FAaria w2t §, SETh 6 ATAGAAT F THTeE H ara
T IS TS H IGT G, AAT(—
srene
1. o 1 & IT-gT (1) H, “OSTa o AfHT w (Fearee) Afaaam, 20137 ek, dAhi Ud wsHl F arg
CHERTE T e e ® T Rt a9z e G s



THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART IT—SEC. 3(i)]

2. 9T 3 FWT FAT SATEATUT 92 91T 3-F #H, ‘W7 aeawr” &t & oy, “yames” og@ staeartoa far
ST
ATAH
gITe Y aftia #< (gerae) afafRae, 2013

(a9 2013 FT g9 ATAIH .28)
1. afRrq@ A wd ww.—(1) 39 AfAfAEw F dee geF atiq w7 (Ferrge) safafaas 2013 FEr S
(2) & T TATET ZT|
2. 39 2005 ¥F gorre AfAAEw 8 &t arr 2 F weegw. 49 go afda T afa=Em, 2005 (AT T9F q1E qA
sfgfaaa & =0 § [Afdee) §, gmr 2 # @< (1) F are Aetoied e sfaemfoa B s, seaiq—
“(STST) “Fehg o | | (AHATeiad % o7y gershariaeh ATeEe 1 STTRT A9 2-
(i) ﬁwaﬁw’m,wmﬁmw\mqw%mm;
(i) Tewr=t &1 gora, widemor ar gfweor;
(ifi)  FTaTeeR FIAT, QAT UF THITIS] A(gd Fls BIH ST FHIAT AT T&TH HLAT; A
(iv) ECHTLT AT AT AT S 6 ATeET & T, 4TS, ATieq AT et o1 srare 41 390+ Sfae (Rhe) #ir
Nt
3. a4 2005 ¥ Yo AfAFEw 8 & 7€ aRT 3-F F A AT, — A ATIaT &, a7 3 F 1%, Featafag g
AT T T, A —

“3-F TAGEIAT A1 FT FRATEIT .— =0 ATATH 77 395 g a=r0 U Tt # g B aa ¥ e gv
ST, ATIFT VST T & ATHIET § AT T 26 AT T I el aqre v =i & @i saast
FATTeAd LT & [oIT Toiei (v Tand &l wATead HT gl gl”

4. 99 2005 ¥ yerrer srfafaaw 8 i arr 8 # "ertge.—qo srfafaaw @, g 8 # IT-omy (1) ® “aiie GH” qF@i &
(A EEE RN ECRIEECUER R Ll
5. ¥ 2005 ¥ Yo sAfafAaw 8 f g 27 F dveT.— At €, gy 27 7, ‘O afqaaq” 9@ @t Fal
aTT &, 3 fory g wfaera” ereE i e s
6. ¥ 2005 ¥ Yo ATAFEw 8 FY arxr 51 F dAMHT.—TF Afef=aT , g7 51 H-
(F) ST-GTT (1) |, “HATT AT AL TG 6 TG, “FT UH T 87 963 . qA7i0q Fohw S,
(@) 3T-9TT (2) H-
(iy < FATHT AT TATLT FARE” MEET & a1, “TH AT T2 ATTATAT T JT03M
(i) “SIT AT ATgA § 10 ST ¥ & «&al F a7 ‘A7 Rl o\ dreEt gy a9w s R
STTOT, 47
(i) TTH TEGE H, “F R H ST & Ag AGET & 917, AT T AT’ MEE AT HATOT T T

(1) SI-GTT (3) H, “ATAF AT AHTAT FT TATL Fls AT GAH AGET % 17, “&fT FqQ° MEE AT qATAT 617
ST,
() SU-GTT (4) §, ITE F Frama-



[SFT [I-@TE 3 (i)] qRA T SIS ¢ STHTEROT 7

(i) " FATHT A7 TAT FFRE” TFE F a1, “THG A AR AT AT R ST qour
(i) % FATHT AT TATLT FATH HT 396 FIT GHIF TG F FATAT AT TR 6 77, “TEH AL 067
EERGRIECREL b
(.) ST-GTT (5) H, “F ATAH AT HATHI” AT % aT&, “THY AT TIE AT HATOT B [T
[T, 5. T 11020/5/2014-F & T ]

TRt g, 9T af=a
NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 28th July, 2015

G.S.R. 596(E).—In exercise of the powers conferred by section 87 of the Punjab Reorganization Act, 1966
(31 of 1966), the Central Government hereby extends to the Union territory of Chandigarh, the Punjab Value Added
Tax (Amendment) Act, 2013, (Punjab Act No.28 of 2013), as in force in the State of Punjab on the date of publication
of this notification, subject to the following modifications, namely:-

MODIFICATIONS

1. In sub-section (1) of section 1, after the words, figures and brackets “the Punjab Value Added Tax
(Amendment) Act, 2013”, the words “as extended to the Union territory of Chandigarh” shall be
inserted.

2. In the new section 3-A as inserted by section 3, for the words “State Government”, the word
“Administrator” shall be substituted.

ANNEXURE
THE PUNJAB VALUE ADDED TAX (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2013
(Punjab Act No. 28 of 2013)

1. Short title and commencement.—(1) This Act may be called the Punjab Value Added Tax
(Amendment) Act, 2013.

(2) It shall come into force at once.

2. Amendment of section 2 of Punjab Act 8 of 2005.—In the Punjab Value Added Tax Act, 2005
(hereinafter referred to as the principal Act), in section 2, after clause (j), the following clause shall be
inserted, namely:-

“(jj) “‘electronic governance” means for use of electronic medium for.-
(1) filing of any form, return, application, declaration or any other document;
(ii) creation retention or preservation of records;
(iii) issue or grant of any form including statutory forms, orders and certificates; and

(iv) receipt of tax, interest, penalty or any other payment or refund of the same through
Government treasury or authorized banks.”

3. Insertion of new section 3-A in Punjab Act 8 of 2005.—In the principal Act, after section 3, the
following section shall be inserted, namely:-

“3-A. Implementation of electronic governance.— Notwithstanding anything contained in this Act or
the rules made thereunder the commissioner may by an order with the approval of the State Government
implement electronic governance for carrying out the various provisions of the Act and the rules made
there under.”

4. Amendment of section 8 of Punjab Act 8 of 2005.—In the principal Act, in section 8, in sub-section
(D), for the words “thirty two paise”, the words “fifty five paise” shall be substituted.

5. Amendment of section 27 of Punjab Act 8 of 2005.—In the principal Act, in section 27, for the words
“five per cent” wherever occurring, the words “six per cent” shall be substituted.

6. Amendment of section 51 of Punjab Act 8 of 2005.—In the principal Act, in section 51.-

(a) in sub-section (1), after the words, “place or places”, the words “or in such manner” shall be
inserted;

(b) in sub-section (2).-



THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART IT—SEC. 3(i)]

(i) after the words “The owner or person Incharge of”’, the words “the goods or” shall be
inserted.

(ii) after the words “as are being carried in the goods vehicle”, the words “or by any other
means’’ shall be inserted, and

(iii) in the first proviso, after the words “outside the State in the course of”, the words
“intrastate or”, shall be inserted.

(c) in sub-section (3), after the words “the driver or any other person Incharge of the goods”, the
words “and goods” shall be inserted;

(d) in sub-section (4), excepting the provision.-

(i) after the words “The owner or person Incharge of”, the words “the goods and” shall be
inserted; and

(ii) after the words “the declaration duly verified by him to the owner or person Incharge of”,
the words “the goods and” shall be inserted;

(e) in sub-section (5), after the words “the driver or the owner of”, the words “the goods and” shall
be inserted.

[F. No. U-11020/5/2014-UTL]
RAKESH SINGH, Jt. Secy.

Printed by the Manager, Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054.



