
/ 

' i, ~8111 
" .. 
{«t. 49. 

)-~ 

·~fflM· 
(31Dlti1M) .,_," ... 

'fttrr~, ~iff'P ~ tfRcfU t t1.,;l. 

Pi::~ '!~(srr.) .- , ~w,_ ~ ,ijlff ,' ;pJ ,f<i~f(1f~M -~, f-;i-tl er{ 

·/;" \ ~e;~~~'.~ :~qfi,1,,':tr:';~ :! 5ft'Ga':: ~~h¢ ';t;:lt<i\«HI ; ,'tl~l'ffl"ur if,f 
, ·-•: .• I , A • ' ·, -4: ;~.t~t'~1 • ' , 

;~~:,~ ' ~ ;·~:,( V< · · · :ii'f!r S;;;:zt'iC:': ... 

,._; ··' 
': : 
:,. 



. \\ ~ !':..: 

:0:tf'.',:· ,'.)),:;<1,;, 

't; , 

l ,· 



~ "'~r ... ~...­
~ \9 «'( <ttl.9~. 

~r.=f· ~T ~ ~ cN'T ~~T 

~, ~\'9~ 
_·, . , t GAq"f\' cit 19 ~ l1i1' -q_,~vr <fi"r ·tr'!,itfa ~eq ~; ~e­

~0, "it&i1Sla1u tr~" (!\ln\TaT'(tll') 1f nr.rtcfi" ~ ~) ~t•,9~ 'fi1 
,,_,__ ~ ~ iITT' tri:.J 
'tf ·:;_;:firqr-f ~ t ~ "1 ~ tfq'f mn i mti ~ m cf, 

./Sil.. ·~. 
;}.:·~~ 

• .:'_;- .'frof lf11i't~ "1 ~ <-ri if ir~w ~ ~ mr f<11=iiftef@a 
"tw q~ ~firn ~ :-

·:159 

;,r, 9. ~ ffl~ ~!IT f<nTN ~ ~ m al!fT ITTl'T ~fl.r- ~fo"f?T "iilll'. 
·· , 9.t\9, ~ i3IT ~r. 
~ .. 

. ·'; ~- ~ m~ if,~ wl'i m lf ~ ;;rqfw.r :=r ~,-- qf;:'+ff'ffr( 
.. ! . 

"mimr"· it mll'sra i fq~ mrr <lft ~f srcn: trfmi=r 
lfT RQ'Trl' ff'ITT ~ 5Wfi'll T f;rzrm <fi Wrf ef;m <fiff trfirfu 
l!T ~ l1T ~ m'.1TT71:: ITT'D" full<@ ~I' ~ q;)'{ m'f:ffo:'f 
m"{ ~ (~ cr,) i;:t.a'1a' ~Ti'TT ~Ti, n<l'T rr,,zr 
m:,m,: ilTU fif~ f.Fir ~ oi1i ~ t 

( •-) ''~" i mm t ~ mrr,:r ~ ;r,r .fil~ 
f;;p,a- \j~ wa-if a--.. 

((%) iim; 
. (~) UtilTiim; 
(~) ~m; 
(~rt) efooii me!'; m"{ 

(q'f'i:1 )· ~111' fcrn1;:r tl"Tf <fi"T ~~ 
9;1'Tff t 

(11') "ij~" ff ,;mrnq ~ ~ ffl. <t>TliJcl'fu f;;rn-if\T 'J;(l~ 

' mTrf m:rr l;fif ~lfiT ~ Sfro;1f ijl<l" :i- ~ tr' ~ f~.; 
. .-,{~.-_,r ~ --~ .r-~ ·f<nn.f _~ ofij' -im .i . 

·•.: .. · C: !l~~~~~,~~:~~mt,:,I·i~\;~~d~S~S,, ..• ,x <1. • t 

,• •' 





-(P 
M 

~ 

i 
1€ 

re: ~ Ii= (Y i;;; I:; ~ ~ 'i tlf- ~ & ( ~ ~ ~- I t-,' g ft:" re: 'i I~ llJ" f f t:~"" ~-ta~ !id i1._ ir& "'ii l! if " g I ; :~ ::: 1.~hli h:~ ~,.,.,_-;!lfg,h . t.1:J l i' i, i _· 
~ ~it'g:<iii i ~ ~ 'ti~ t ~ I f& If... ] I le 1¥ ' ~-' 
i f,,. ~-ii l1i'li: :: I 1; ~."1!:~i ·h;, ... :i. I;'.~ ! ~ -I 
~ ,Hf ~i! Ht~~ !?l!!nl'hS J;"i I I"." l> j •--•~ 
1 'I!'.! t ~1 ~ 1: !I; d !,r~! ~ 1 ~ 1-it ,,. 1- I i i ., 
"' 1 ~, !~t l · t.,r I i,,.: Hh1 u I i b ,,. ,,. ; 
t .!e-li ~ :w-"' i JI; i t ti ti:" If" a :, i 's l~ ; ~-. _<_; 
IS ~ ~ I ::,{ i; & ~ ! 1cr I~ 'Ii- '~ I;; 'i 'tJ ~ ~ Ii ~ _i; i ~ I;; t:< ~ . :· 

,e ::~1·i ~~ I~*~_ " ~ r. ~.!'.~ HI ii"' :d~ ~ ~ i 1. _ :iJ_·t ! - fu: ~ 1+ CW - • i :If ~ 'g t rti ~ ~ ~ tt;; 1lr q::. j f ! ": jg. ~ g l fr~- Ir ~ ,:. 

;~t1'!5°-i. ~fii {!;~:! E J~i;hrU:;tfiJ·f ~i j"l~ i~ i~"J 
...,..,If~ 1W t!; !Z ::; :; J;: <.:!. ~ ·• t i ltl" Kr I Ii; -1o-~i:i-- Ii;' b,Y..-.,. ,-.,.. °"' /W...-.. ,--.. 

,; ~ If w - ,ti' If- w 
-'e:'.'. l;r i ::,{ i -,i;, q::: ,iv- '!Ir - -- - . l; -- - - -tyjirlc (Y . -d!t~ )o .~ (Y . 

---:~ --.,~ ..... ~~~~· 

... 'i • ~_; " 



Sections 

1. Short titl 0. 

2. Defmitions. 

Table of Contents 

' 
3. Salaries of members 

4. Constituency ·r-dlowance lo members . 

5. Free transit by State Transpor t. 

6. Travelling ,md d·aily allowance. 

7. Medical attendance and treatment etc., to mem­
bers. 

8. Provision for residence, telephone and staff for 
Leader of opposiiion. 

9. Power to make rules. 

10. Repeal. ' ~- ' -



MADHYA PRADESH ACT 

No. 7 of 1973. 
' 
: _MADHYA PRADESH \IIDHAN 'SABI--IA SADASYA 
. VETAN TATHA BHATTA A.DHINIYAM, 1972. 
ved the assent of the Governor on the 29th January, 1973 assen t. 
t-st published in the "Madhya Pradesh Gazette" (Extraordinary} 

. 'ated the /st Fc!bruary, 1973.J 

: ct to provide for the salaries and allowances of mem­
:"bers· of the State Legislative .A.ssembly. 

,_ ' 

·.· Be it enacted by the Madhya Pradesh Legislature ' in 
•. Twenty-third Year of the Republic of India as 
ws:-

' L This Act may be ca lled the Madhya Pradesh Short title, 
: ·an Sabha Sadasya Vetan Tatha Bhatta Adhiniyam, 

:.2. In this Act, unless the context otherwise requires,- Definitions. 

( a_) "Committee" means a Select Committee of the 
Legislative Assembly or a Committee consti­
tuted under the rules of procedure of the 
Legislative Assembly or a Committee appoint­
ed by the Speaker or the State Government 
and includei the statutory Boards and the 
Boards appointed by the State Government ; 

(b) "Member" means a member or the Madhya Pra­
desh Legislative Assembly, but does not 
iilch,ide-

(i) a Minister; 

(ii) a Minister of State; 

(iii) a Deputy Minister ; 

(iv) 

the 

363 

, .. - : 



364 

transit by 

Travelling and 
daily allowance. 

Medical allendan­
ce and lrtatme.nt 
etc; to . members. 

Provision lor resi ­
dence, telephonP 
and staff' for 
Leader of oppo~;. 
tion. 

6. Every memuer shall be entitl~cl. · :wh'il~ :tra . , 
on publie business, to travelling· and daily allowances 
such rates and upon such conditions as may be determi .. 
by ru les made by the St ate Governmenl. ) 

~ 

7. (1) Subj ecl io ,1ny ru les made in this behalf .g 
tile State Government, every member shatl himself be entl 
Jed free of charg~. to accommodation in hospitals mau 
tained by- the State Government and also to medical tre4 
ment available in such hospitals as admissible to a. Gif 
ernment 3ervant under the rule making control of the Sta~ 
Government drawing a pay of Rs . 225 per month or ahov: 
personally for himsel f. 

(2) Until rules a,re made under sub-section (1), ru ,, 
relating to medical attendance and treatment made by ' 
Governor under the proviso lo article 309 oI the Consti\ 
tion of India shall apply to a member as they apply '( 
afore.;aid Government servant personally for himself, S\l 
ject · to modification that controlling authority for the p., 
pose of any claim of reimbursement shall be Secreta·:· 
Madhya Pradesh Vidhan Sabha. .. 

'J 

8. ( 1) The member who is the Leader of op posit{' 
shall, in addition to whatever he is entitled to as such me · 
her under sections 3. 4, 5, 6 and 7, be entitled,- ·' 

(a) without payment of rent, to lhe use of a furnJ.s 
ed residence at . ~~opal for the perio~ he is -~ 
Leader of oppos1t10n and for the penod of •q 
month immediately thereafter and no chat . 
shall fall upon the Leader of the opposition/ 
re3pect of the maintenance of such residef 

, j 

(b) at the cost of th~ Government, to the provl$.lQ 
of a telephone at the residence provided to b 
under clause (a) : · 



z~ . 

l 
_,(~_::i;:··:==P=ro=v=i=d=ed=t=h q=a :=q=:=:=~=ch=(:=~=g=:=s' _=f~=:='.~=t:=u=:=·:~=_~=a=ll=: g=· 7=s~=, a=l=l =h=e=====

3 
=
65

::,,, 

::iI\ borne by the Leader of opposition; 

:Ji' - (c) at the cost of th~ Government, to service or a 
'> ;I,_: typist and a peon. 

:: ·:1-:-\ , ' 
· :;,Jt, (2) The expenditure to be incurred in respect of fur-

': ti; ishing of the res idence providf·d under sub-section (I) and 
e annual expenditure to be incurred in respect or upkeep, 

{UJ'ua l repairs and maintenance of such res idence sha ll be 
: ~j.ectcto the same monetary limits ai> one fixed by sc.ctlon 
:of the Mad_hya Pradesh M&nlri (Vetan Tatha Bhatta) 

31hiniyam. 1972 (No. 25 of 1972) and th i:! rules made there­
pder in respect of a re!-idence provi ded to a Minister under 

._fie said Adhiniyam, 

.. (3) The date on which a member becomes or' ceased to 
··, ~ the Leader of the Oppos itio n shall be published in thc­
\a zett e and :;i ny such notifica tion sha ll be co nclusin evi­

i~t.ce of the fad tl,at he beca me or ce,3sed to be the Lea der 
J'Oppo.:, ition on that date ior the purposes of this section . 

'T.',: 

( 4) For the purpose of thi s section-

( a) "L211(kr of oppcsition'' rn eans that member who 
is ior t ht' time being the leader in the State 
Legis lc:1Uve Assembly of the party in opposi­
t iz: 11 to the State Governmen t having the 
gre;atest numerical strength in that Assembly 
and i i any doubt arises as to w hich is or wa s 
at anv ma terial time the leader in that Assem­
bly c1f :-:.ucb a party, the question, shall be 
dt·cided. fo r the purposes oi this section, by 
the Speaker of the said Assembly and his 
dec_ision, certified in writing under hi s hand, 
shall b6 fina! .and conclusive; , 

~)ii(&s,tgfm1t(,ti);<)l:w'te)l\f ~l~!f i~~a,rt~i~ ,,ll!)d:gt~•\ ,,fi;, \•j 











I'- ··~ ~ ~ 3Mfl@ "ffli 

~ ~ ~ 1;fTTfR (fir-Ir "ffli 

fw:) t- ffl ~ ~. ~ 
..,n. 2-22 0°d1-EPI~ 1f;W38 ftl. l). 
~. ~ 30-5-2001." 

~ 102J 

( a:lfll~l-lUI ) 

~ * Q ch If¥ I a 

w~ am fcf~ q;r:f m'lWT 
lf5fR,li, Gl3i ~ ~ "icf1", ~ 

WilF, ~ }4 ~ 2002 

~ 3104121-~~@. 7T./01.-u'd1W1,; ~~tt'>TT<fil HCJf(-tf&\i ~, hrcrq1.:'ftr-TM; ,s-4-2002 -inr~:r1m1 

<l>l ~ IDff m ~ i, ~ 'Wml~ <fol~ t-~ ~ %'lll ~ t. 

203 

0tllw1~ ~ ~ tf> ::rm~ om :Hl?.W·f'm. 
ant.~- aai1&1.:.,1, TI-~. 



3 ... .:..". ==========0="=1•='='~=--==·="='"=i .. =2•=·==2=00=2============'= 
0'ffi BI I~ "1f 'lR'!ll 
c..,..,- 17 W\ 2002) • 

l.htl\l'liJ PM'f lNT ~ ( ffl, 'lfflT nil1' ~) ( ~) 

~. 2002 

0tih•t11,i ftlURlNI~(~. \f'ffl'Wffl~) ~. 1972 (lli. 7 WI_ 1973 )<lit 
~ ~ 3lfilfll••· 

' 
"1mf ~ % ~ qif if d"ffi«•i<; ~-~ ~ f1L-1fl1fold ~ii~ 3U""~ 

iii,-

1. ( 1) ~ 31ft:tf.p:p::r 0-alw1,:; ~llR 'lfl:rT ~ (ffi, 'ffflamffi) ( B'ffi'"-R) ;ffi'f-.rf::rrq. 

2002 ('ii. 17 lfl.2002) if,~i;,11Q.'II. 

IITTT4(TT)~. 2. (~) 0-dh-1•1ey fcNR 'B''ITI" ~ (~, 'lt'ffi (!'m-ffi) atf~. 1972 ~ ~.m:r 4 ( T!) ii 

~ ,r-; "m '11" * - "' .. <:I m """'" """"' f<l;'ii ;;mt . 

.. -'-- . -- . ........ --' -~~ .. ll( 1qq<4 ... f§•,11\Mf ICl'-11"1 ""1flffl' q11(•'1CIH, 11;1-.1q, 26 •U"1, 2002 ~ ~11~(1 l~<U Tim. 

""T', ~ 24 ~ 2002 

iifill'ffi 3104/21-31/SIT~uti'iJ. ll.101.-~*'ltfcl\Wl'~ ~ 348't~ (3) ~ ~i{ Ouifl•I~ fq-,..rr-:i ~ w.q 

c-..a, ""'""" il',ia) (W'Rl 3lf'lf.!oq, 2002 (in. " m. 2002 l -.rr amii ~"""'""-.,"""""'ii - N.lPI@ t-,;,u 
.mil. 

• 

0"t11«•11.; ~~~-::rm ll' 'ij-qJ 31tb11•p:w. 
;mj. ~- dii1idJ11, TI-1Cfffi . 



0tfle•1~ ~. ~ 24 ~ 2002 

CHHA TnSGARH ADHINIY AM 
(No. 17 of 2002) 

.... 

{HE CHHATI'ISGARH VIDHAN SABHA SADASYA (VETAN, BHATIA TATHA. 
PENSION (SANSHODHAN) ADHINIY AM, 2002. 

An Act further to amend the Chhattisgarh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya (Vetan, Bhatta Tatha 
Pension) Adhiniyam, 1972 (No. 7 of 1973), 

Be it enacted by the ChhattiSgarh Legislature in the Fifty-third Year of the Republic of 
India as follows:-

I. (l) This Act may be called the Cbhattisgarh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya (Vetan, Bhatta 
Tatha Pension) (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 2002 (No. 17 of 2002). 

(2) It shall come into force from the date of its publication in the Gazette. 

2. (I) In Section 4 (c) of the Chhattisgarh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya (Vetan, Bhatta Ta1ha 
Pension) Adhinjyam, 1972 (No. 7 of 1973) for the word "three hundred" the words 
"two hundred fifty" shall be substituted. 

(II) At the end of Section 4 ( c) the words "Members shall further be entitled to daily 
allowance at the rate of Rs. 250 per day for the days they attend meetings of 
Vidhan Sabha or meeting of committees" shall be inserted. 

204 (I) 

Shnrt title •nd cmn, 
meJl(ement. 

Amendment in Sec­
tion 4 (c). 



,. 
__ f 

-• 
··~w ~ -3EPf'a- ~ 
~~~'JflffR (f-RT ~ 
rog) ~~tu~-~ 
"iff. 2-22-iffflfiill~ Tl'ifZ/38 fu. ~. 
~. ~;Jf<'fi" 30-S-2001.'' 

~31] 

( 3ttll~l<UI ) 

~ ~ Y ~ I ttlhi 

~. ~ 15-'li\Cm 2005 

~ Frl<li" •·-mtr~r~,: 
W. 3Tl.~17/2CiJl.'" 

.. 

~ 1288/21-31' /i:mqtll/ 04. - Ui1~Q111$ ~ Q,:rr cf,T f.l'-t~ffiirt ~ ~ q"( ft-ri'fi i l -02-2005 "1t 
~~~imr61"¢t.~~.f;l-~t~~~:;;f@Tt. 

61 

?.h11¼l 11i$ ~ ~ ~ ;in:J ~ ~ 3-11~!!!!:J~R, 

~ ftiw ~' ~-~. 



62 

·, :· 

@i:fte~ I~ ~ 

(~27~2004) 

··::.·:.:..::.;.:,_:::::~:4111 

eti1tM4 ~tf'll~m, t:fffi~q-·w:r, ti,n~=1 a1~Ac1,:,, 2004 
~ ; ' 

--~-- • 
• 

..... 

;, 

l... 



) ___ , 

mfh-P1~ u~. ~ 15 q:;t:cftt 2005 62 (1) *============================= 
Gift.ii I(!\ ~ 

('""'"'"' lr-\ 2004) 

eiflem; ~ ~ ~, ;hr;r, lftfT cf1IT 1i'1'R adflPt,qq, 1972 (li~-7 ~ 

1973) ao'\ ail< e,~~d ~ 81\ >!~f.lqq. 

I. (I) ~ ~ 0rj)f111~ fcr<lT-J flm ~~am \fi!T, ~ ~. 2004 «ftm;mriflll!il'TN. 

~'Tl. 

• 

2. i1illa•1, fa,,,., !NT ,W,, iiir.r, '1ilT R'lf "'1r.! ~. (1972 ait ""1 ~-'@ "1U·4 .. ..mR. 

~ i\; 'IT'! ii f.riey t) o;t 'Im-4 il - "ilia ,v,rr" i\; "'"1 'R '1-; "qi., _ .. ""1rlo •" 

5. 

' 6. 

,. 

f<,;,rr .rt. 

"1U-4 "e/;t """1U (<TT) i\; "'"1 G< f.lR@fl<a ,{ """1U mo o;t -ffl, ~ - "1U·4"..mR. 
• 

" (<TT) 3, ~ ii; @1(, faRi\ - flim, !NT 'fi1 ~ 'IT m¥a,i\ ., ~. >WT ~ 

"4 ti" 

. (<TT) 

t ~ - <tt ua,m,ft ""'11"'1 t am itm ml!fu., m., fufu t <('Ii~ 

· ~. "-" m t l('f,' ~ ""'t fel1( ~ .. <TT !ii - .. m ., " ii ~ 
l:f.l,s ,re si-\ is ~ ,wt. " 

J'MCT ( I ) il ,r-; """"'1: - " ii; "'"1 'R ,r-;· "<('Ii - <r.m! "'11:" 

<'!Im ~ ,nit, $: 

3'lsm (I) ii;"""~ ii; "'"1 'R RR@fl<a Sqj'!' ""1fur f<,;,rr .nt, 
3l'lfu:-
"""l!, ~ ""'! """' SN, ><f.t -car-t ii; lmt ""1 <('Ii >m: asfu; ii; am 

""" a;f.t "'1 ~ irrr ... 



62 (2) 

8. 

(tr.,) 31mm(2)Jf,~'·~~"~oo-=r~~"ara_~•· ~~ 

'11W ~ ~ (2) ~ G"lfqTQ, f.lRJR7>(@<l ~ 3lk ~ Si!W, ~-:-
. ' 

'•~ ~. "l:f\o ~ ~H <fit~ q tfj- i'ft;f, 3fR-~ ~ ~ ~ ~ 
.. 'lft~M. ,, 

~ ~ lfiT 'TTTT 6 q; 1 q ~ "cft;:r ~ qra- {fr n ~ ~ ~ ~ "~ if-SITT'.' ~ 

~~-

9. · I@~ <61 '-00"-6 1s ~ ~ q"{ f.li::;wsf@:1 ~-~;tr-~, ~ :-

''mu 6. ~ zjqr.J tTT ~ ~-* qm/qfi:;t liT ~ 3TIT',fff ?!'fa:~ mt~~ 
( "f & J:if . <@lj"H.lfl w ~ ~ ~ t ~ « ~ ri .fil' ~ ~ Wl"!. inf.l" m 
q'm) tffrlfRR~~~-·· 

10. it¥~ :fl- tmr-7 1 ?f ~ 0 lf.fj ~ qiq ~" ~ ~ r« 1lf&c{ "tfr-i ~"~ 
~~-

f:,. .. (, - : ; , i., .. , .. :, ;,_), ,1:,mun:;m .. \ ~ 

~ 12ss/21-3l/~/04. - 'ffiff ifi ~ii;~ 348 $ was (3) $ ~ ~· mi1t1•ii!> ~ ~ 
~-~, '1"flT ~-~ {~) ~' 2004 (iii. 27 ~ 2004) cfiT ~~~it!;~«~ 
~ P4;m ~ !. ' ' ' 

mf1wl$ ifi_ u,aqq1{1 %;- ~~am 3-ll~llj+m, 

-~ ftil. ~, 31t-•. 

. 
l 

.(_~. 



• 

' ,,. 
,, 

CHHATIISGARI{ ADHJNIYAM 

(No. 27 of 2004) 

CHHATTISGARH VIDHANSABHA SADASYA VETAN BHATTA TATHAPENSION 
SANSHODHAN ADHINIYAM, 2004 

SECTION: 

1. Short Title and Commencement 

2 Amendment ofSection-4 

3. Amendment of Section - 4-A 

4. Amendment of Section - 4 - B 

s. Amendment !Jf Section - 4 - C 

6. In Sedition of New Section - 4 - D 

7 . Amendment of Section - 5 - A 

8. Amendment of Se<:tion -. 6 - A · 

9. Amendment of Section - 6 - B 

10. Amendment of Section - 7 1 

INDEX 

@ 
62 (3) 



62-(4) 

Short title and 
Commrncement. 

CHHArii§GARH ACT 

(No. 27 of 2004) 

1HE CHHATIISGARH VIDHANSABHA ,SADASVA(VETAN,BHAITA 
TATHA PENSION), (SANSHODHAN) ACT, 2004. 

An Ad further to amend the Chhattisgarh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya (Vetail, Bbatta 
Talha Pension), Adhiniyam, 1972 (No. 7 of 1973) 

Be it enacted by the Chhattisgarh Legislature in the Fifty-Fifth y~ar of .the Republic of 

India as follows:-

1. - (I) 

~~ 

~ 
This Act may be called the Chhattisgarh Vid~an Sabha Sadasya Ventan 

Bhatta Tatha Pension (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 2004. 

(2) - It shall .come into force from the date ofits publication in the gazette. 

Amendment_ ·of 2. In Section 4 of the Chhattisgarh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya (Vetan Bhalla Tatha Pension) 
Adhiniyam, 1972 (No. 7 of 1973) (hereinafter referred to as the Principa1 Act), for the 

words "Three Thousand" the words .. Five Thousand" shall be substituted. 

Section 4. 

Amendme•t or 3:-
Section 4-A. 

Amendment er 4. 
Section 4-8. 

Amendment or 5. 
Section 4-C. 

Insertion or new- 6. 
Sec:tioa 4-D .. 

Amendmen1 or 7. 
Sei:tion 5-A. 

In Section 4-A of the Principal Act for the words•• Four Tho.,:Sand .. the words .. Five 

Thousand" shall be substituted. • 

... 
In Section 4-B of the Principal Act for the words .. One Thousand" the words "Two 
Thousand .. shall be substituted. 

For sub-section (ii) of Section 4-C the following sub-section shall be substituted, .. 
namely:-

"(ii) For those days in which a member attend the meetings ofVidhan Sabha/ 

Committees. In Capital or out of State for such mectings member entitle 

additional daily allowance at the rate of Rs. 250/- per day before~ day and 

. _ . . after a day of dat~ o~ such meetings." . . . _ -\.-. _ 

After Section 4-C of the Pnnc1pal Act, the followmg Section shaJI be inserted; -

namely:-

"4-D. - There shall be to every member. stationery allowance of Four Thousand 

rupees per mensem." 

· In Section 5-A of the Principal Act.: 

(i) in sub.:.section (1) for the words "Seve_nty Five Thousand" the words .. One 

Lac Twenty Five Thousand" shall be substituted . 

• 
(Ii) . for first proviso of the sub-section ( l) the following proviso shalt be subs-

tituted, namely :-

'.'Provided that every member shall entitle for both side Fiv~ Air Joumies 

with one person accompanying him". 

(iill lri sub-section (2),. for the words "Forty Thousand" the words .. Sixty Thou~ 

sand" shall be substituted; and after sub-section (2) the following proviso 

shall be added, namely:-

.,, 



,.. 

r .. . -• 

·:;. 

::r-

8. 

9. 

. ~•I<; ~, ~ is ~ 2005 

"Provided that such person within limit ''Sixty Thousand" shal I eneitle 
for Three Air Joumies". 

In Section 6-A ofthc Princip~I Act, for the words "Three Thousand Five Hundred" the 

words" Ten Thousand" shall be substituted. 

For Section 6~B the following Section shall be substituted, namely:-

"6-8. There shall be paid a pension ofrupees five thousand permensem to 
the spouse if any or dependent of a member/ex-member for a period often . 
years from the date of his death". 

10. · In Section 7-1 ofthe Principal Act for the words•· one thousand five hundred" the 
words "three thousand" shall be substituted . 

. . 

• 

r 

62 (s) 

Amendmrnt of 
Section 6-A. 

Amendment ·of 
Sectien ,.e. 

Amendment 
Section 7-1. 

of 















, ih 

! 
;~~l:f(R;\r ~ ~ 

¥r;<r.$~~ (fiif;n ~ 
·-.-.lJ ~ffl'Q~. ~ 
· :~ -22-@-tflWfif ~38 fu. lt. 

-,,.1 ~ •• 
·]<_·11;,, [~"flW, ~,. 

, l I II l-•. 

'j I 

' ' 

! ! I . 
'I: I I 
I'' I • 

I , '~• • r • 

--~ iv} 

.. ·;J,:•--•,<:,',_' 
,;;~~,f_.,;' 

(~) 

~~Qqilfelti 

. ' ., 

~ ~ '. Bift:e,t4JVit 
tfcft. 114/-009/2003/20-01-03. ' 1 

~; ~ ~ 10 3fJffij 20IJJ-~ 19, lffi 1928 

~ am ~~,41 cnm fcf'TilT 
q,tlH4, ~ ~ ~ 'lf<R; ~ 

455 

fih1\;i•i~ t" ~ $ ~ 1" lllil 311~i:JltR, 

ftlm,rrftt(~, -n--~. 



I . 

I I 

, I, 

: I I 

·; 

,i 
'i 

0i:flt111, ~ 
(~SWf..2007) 

U-tfit141f ilNPr lNI '14\11 ~t 'fflT ffffl"~ ( ~ ) 
~,2007 

ittl1tMf ftn{A lNT ~ ~. -qffl'llllf if\'R-dl~tPI, 1972 ( lti1fflfi 7 ~ 1973) 1fit 
~mq3lflrf.tqit 

'ITT« ~ it .J1~81q~ qtf Tf ~\ftw111 ~ ~ lIT{I r-f"1ft.1Rlm ~ lf lffl' -olfqf.filfi:@ 

i'I:-

'Rf ~lfiltffius~tiN1tM4~ll'lf~~.'lllftfltl~(m~~'T.f) 

~. 2007 <ti6<i'll411!. 

, 

l1Rf •.-••-~ 2. th-itw1<4 WtfFf lNT ~ ~. ~ 1flrr~·atf\d¾illi, 19n (~ 1 ~ 1973) ('ifl ~ llltfi 
1W<ffiI, ~-~ ~ ~il f.rM! t), _1$}' !l'RT 5-cfi11, 

"(;)) ~ 6 ('ifi) ~ ffiffl*~~~ifil~mqft" ~~(',(~ 
ftFWRJ~WUWfflif~~ 3'ta~~3R'·~'mll:'0Jfi'~ 
'l'f'.f ifi"(Rr-rmmtg:lll'a'~~~ierlftr-l~~M. lnliwi~ollftf;~ 
F-l <h'r u'fflo ~ ~n ~ 'tfti{r if wt" F:TI( ~ <fiB 16' \ft~~.,. 

~. ~ 10 3Pffif 2007 

1lildlti' 1028/tt. 171/21-3V1H./0. "11./07.-"1«1 ~ ~ '$ ~ 348 *1PI" (3) $~if @WltMI ~ lNT 

~~. ~cftnffi (mitwf) ~. 2007 (~ 8 lfl2007) 'qtT ~ ~ {lllqqlct~~Int~Rlftila 

i.m-.-fflt. 

wi;ft.,114 $ ~ t"-11'1-« R i\l~til(, 

~-~,~-~ 

♦ 



... 

.. 
,, .r 

CHHAT11S0ARH ACT 
( No. 8 of 2007 ) 

THE CIIHA.TJ'ISGA.RH VIDHAN SABB.A SADASYA VETAN, BHA1TA TATHA 
PENSION (SANSHODBAN) ACT, 2007 

' ·. I ·I ' · 

:, ~~~-~ to amead the Cbbattisgarh Vldhan ~baSaduya Vetan, Bbatta Tat!Nt 
dlji~ ;10:211.·. 9am, lm (No, 7 of 1973), 

1: :r : . . 

$e it --1 l)y the Chlmttisgarb Legislature in the Ftfty-eigbth year of the Republic of India 
. r91110ws :- · 

:Ii ;1\ 1,) 
I t I) This Act may be called the Cbbattiaprh Vidban Sabha Sooasya Vctan. Bhatt.a 

Tatha Pension (Saru;hodhan) Adhiniyam, 7IYJ"I. 

{Z) It shall come into force from the date of its publication io the Official Gazette. 

1n Section 5-A of the Cbhattisgarh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya (V etan, Bbatta Tatba Pe~ion) 
Adhiniyam. 1972 (No. 7 of 1973 ), {hereinafter referred ro as the Principal Act) ,-

Fol: ~section (2), the following sub-section shall be substituted :-

"{-2) Every pexson entitled for pension under section 6 (A), subject to such rules which 
may be mede by State Government shall be entitlcd to coupons of Rs. Sixty 
thousand value during one financial year for journey alone or with one person and 
that such persons shall aho be entitled to journey by air within the limit of such 
coupons of ·'Rs. Sixty thous.and"." 

-• ,, ~ 

" 

456 (1) 



l;I II l11i l I 

Ii 

( amntroJT) 
~~Qi:fil~ld 

' 0 

~ ~ ··g:a1a11~1W11 
oqi. 114-009/2003/20-01 -03 ... 

.::;___:__=============::::::::;;:;:::::::::::=========-:-:-::::::: .. :-======-·· --~·--
~ no J ~. ~.~ 911't2008~ 19,ffl-1930 

fuftl~~ffl~ 
~,.~~ft:re\TCl=t,~ 

~.~9"12008. 

-~ 4846/ l 35/21 -'at/fJf./iJ. fT./08.-~f~ttr,U1'1TCfiT~i:.twfult1 ~Fif6q._:~ Ol-O5-2O08 q,l" 

~4i'f ~~~ w.€tt ~ tl4tlltU{lll ft~$ftiiq;~ ~';jffflTt, 

259 

~ ifi ~ ifi ;Jill ~ ~I -3i l~~ll:!flll, 

1t: *· ~, :Jq"-~-



\ 
260 
~ .. =========================== .. 

0tfttt•I~ .sifuf.l~q 
(- IO<r-{2008) 

w41e•tt firllRnr~tn, tmillffifmil~~c1fl, 1912 (li1fr-fi 7 {r-(.1973) 

ilil >ftt e,~111• ..« t11 .. 111f.K •. • 

' ' ,. 
L 

2. 

J. 

4. 

s. 

6. 

(1) 

(2) 

l«3lllif.l•• .. ~""'...n..i. ~--""· "'"""'fu.i (-) 
3'fli.lf.\c1¥1, 20011 <M:i.-51~1II. 

"" 31fllf.l•• lt lll«ai l ~inr-!""1,m,,m, ""'""'°"""llif.l••• 1912 
(-?<r-{1973). 

(1) 'If" 31fllf.l•• -.-5-'0 .. ....,, ( 1) ·-·'<'lit._,. ___ .. O< 

""" " - ~<ii_ .. "1llsa f..11! ~-

(2) '@' >lllif.l•• .(,\ "1115-'0 ;(it """"(1)0< """"'11'""'""""[.j"'f"f"' 
""1lsall,;,ir~3'11f;_-

(3) 

(4) 

•~wt;,;-"""'"'"-"'>lll..r...o;""';;,r"""'-"""'"' 
"""'1, f..@l\ii ~ m,,ir """' ._,.i.,n,,"" if «w<U - it - ""at\ 
~-" 

'@' 3l!liia•• ./iT "1US-'O !Iii """"(2)if"1"'{''m!!lc-"0<"'1'!'R 

- ''<'lit .... --~ll,;,ir "1t{. 

'@' ~ $\ "1U5-'0 4it """"(2)i!>ii,;,'"'-""'""''"6 (o,)"o; 
~t1t~m~"'6-<1i'' 11fa+t11fqa ~~. 

'l." 34fllf.l•• -. ""'6-'" < 1) "'(t.ft,,""1"if ~'""am 'litf- 3'! f.iaf..i • .. "' 

"""'( - ''<T oim!,n/ """"1T'"' ~-""'~ f..11! """· 

"•-•·...., "Ill!<!, "'"1116-'0 "'...n.fu.r .. _,, l, AAm >ml'l(<l;;, 

f..llt ~ "' ~ ""' 1< 2 l "' """" ~ mi >111 m "-"" ""' 'lfil "' m """"" 
ft,f,,;w ""',fi ~ "'""'·,. 

' . 

' 

I 



I 

{ :,, ~"""'·· .~ 2008 260(1) . -,·~ =;======================== 
'' 

--~1· ; ' . ""3',~9~2008 
: , (,i' ' '! 1 • 

· · ~ 4846.1135 /21-></or./•- q_/08. - -~~t ~ 348 t- (3) t """'"~ ~liNR""' 
_ ... , 'l\ffll'llm-!(li>n'I<) ><il<f-l••· 2008 ( ..... 10~2008) .. ~..,_,..-.. ~g-mfm 
flsar-t. . 

' ' " 

~$ ~ ~ ;ni{ °R(ti{1,31~11:lffl(, 

'k t. ""1'Al. ""-'""'1. 

CHHAITlSGARH ACT 

(No. 10 of2008) 

THE CHHATIISGARH VIDHAN SABHA SADASYA VETAN, BHATIA 
TATHA PENSION (SANSHODHAN) ACT, 2008 

Ao Act further to amend the ChbattiJprh YMlban Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bbatta 

Tatha Peasion Adhini)'am, 197:2 (No, 7 of 1973). 

Be it enacted by the Chhattisgarh Legislature in the Fifty-nineth year of the 
Republic of India as follows:-

I. 

2. 

3. 

4. 

(I) This Act may be called the Chlulllisgarh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, 
Bhetta Tatha Pension (Sanshodhan} Adhiniyam. 2008. 

(2) It shall come in to force from the date uf its publication in the Official 
Guene. 

~ipal Act means the Chhattisgarh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta Tatha 
Pension Adhiniyam, 1972 (No. 7 of 1973 ). 

(l) ln sulHcctioo (I) of Section 5-A of the Principal Act for 1he words 
• Rs. One Lac Twenty Five Thousand" the wonb • Rs. Two Lac" shall be -

(2) For tiJ1lt proviso of sulHcction ( l J ofSc<tioo 5-A of 111e Principal Act, the 
following shall be substituted, oamely-

'"Provided that every member may travel alone or with one more 
person subject to the condition that expenditure on the journeys performed 
by nil and air shall not exceed R,,_ lwO Lac in a financial year." 

(3) In sub-secrion (2) of Section 5-A of 1he Principal Act for the words 
"Rs. Sixty Thousand" 111c wonb "Rs. One Lac" shall be subotilutod. 

(4) lnsub-scction(2)ofSactlon5-Aof11lcl'riPcipalActforthefig,.-.,bnicket 
and lctmr"6 (AJ", 111e fiau,o and leU« "6-A" lhall be -

ln11lc occood provioo to Scctioo 6-A (I) of11lc Principol Act, aftcTtbe wonb • 0< 

when amemhe<haviagbeca elected in ab)'c eledion"11lcwonb" orasa....­

ofLok Sabl>tlRajya Sabha" sjlall be -

Slwrt lidt ••d 
CO■IMMtlllltnL 

OeftnilionL 



260 (2) 

.\n1rnun1tnt or 
\ .•. > "iection 6-C 

.\mtndraeat o[ 

',N'lioa 7 (2). 

t' 11•• 

5. 

6. 

( 

~ {NN;I, ~ 9 1tl 2008 \.' 
... 

For Section 6-C of the Principal Act, the following shall be substitull:d. namd:, -

•'&.C Every person who is entitled to pension under Sc'Ction 6-i\. sh.ill be 
entitled for medical reimbursement similar to claim under sub-section (~ ) or Sec I ion 
7 and shall also be paid medical allowance of One thou~nd five hundred.rupc-t.'~ 
per month." 

In sub-seclion (2) of Section 7 of the Principal Act. the words ''for himsl·lr· ~hctl I he 
omined. 

J 



-~ 'qfR * ~ sT1fi 

~ ~ ~ '!:fRJA ( fif:rr sT1fi 

R:<fi"l)ififfi~~. ~ 
.~ -2-22-0'1\e11i6 ~38 fu. ft 
~. ~30-~-2001." 

-,.--

( dltll~l<OI ) 

~~Qehl~IH 

\ ! 
~ ~ -~1 

if<:f,, 114-009/2003/20-01-03." 

~236] ~. ~, ~ 20 ~ 2009-3{JqUT 29, W<fi 1931 

fqf~ 3fR fcmrft qiJ7.f ~ 

ti'.:11f-lll, Gf3i i:hifli!Of ~ 1fcR, ~ 

~. ~ 20 arm; 2009 

~ 5689/151/21--3l/'5rL~- TJJ09. -0~1+\tl~ ~ tl\:il q';f f-tl--lf~f&ct d1f~~ f.re <l't ~ 17-08-2009 ~ 
~ ~ ~-smr it~ t ~-whw-ffilJf <lit~*~~~~ t 

' .. .,.L.· 

471 

€h-flB•I~ ~ ~ ifi ,rq -?1- <l'llT .311~~11j"1f{, 

~~~.~-ffiq. 



472 

0'61.fl11<l ~ 
( ~ 6 ~ 2009) 

....... 
5fli'4114 fimR"'1TI'~'tfiR, 'qffl'{lfffl~(~) ~, 

2009 

861@1, ~lM~~. lfflfnlrfim-f 3ff11F-,4q, 1972 ( ~ 7 WI_ 1973) 

'ilit am-"~a ffl~ 3iftlfltqa 

m=-
1. 

2. 

(1) ~~1'ffltt1rq~ll'll~~."1'fflnmiffR(~)a\f~, 
2009 <f,~l11ll1II. 

0-illtt•I~ fcNr-r 'fl'lfl ~ ~' 'IWf w.H ffi ~. 1972 ( sfiflfefi 7 W'{_ 1973) c1i1 "1RT 

4-'f>-if ~~rn· '%~1:f{~'~'P'IRWu~ ir,mr· !,4ffiftl1f4a M~. 

·~. 

~. ~ 20 :wrnF 2009 

~568911s1121-amn.m. Tf.t09.-m«J~~<NR-a>~ 348 ~w,rg (3) % ~"if uiftw14fcf~A 
~~~. ,rnromim-J (~) 3Tfirf.r;rq, 2009 (~ 6 W'f..2009) ifil ~ ~~%wfuc&1nl~ 
V<filfi@~-:.r@ft. 

:a'ift:w1,; ~ ua,1q1a '% ~ ~ u?.JT at,hn:teH, -~~.~-~-



► 

472 (1) C'-V ================================= --
CHHATI1SGARH ACT 

(No. 6 of 2009) 

.)L"THE CHHATTISGAilR VIDHAN SABHA SADASYA VET~, BHATTA TA-n,A 
PENSION (SANSBODHAN) ACT, 2009 

An Act further to am.end lhe Cbbattiqarlt Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bbatta 
Tatba Pension Adhiniyam, 1972 (No. 7 of 19'73) • 

Be it enacted by the Chhattisgarh Legislature in the Six.tie1h Year of the Republic of 
India as follows :-

.~- I. (I) This Act may be called the Chb.attisgarb Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan., Bhatta 811.ert ti& and 

2. 

'.J'atba Pension (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam. 2009. CnunaammL 

(2) It shall come into force from the date of its publication in the .. Official 
Gazette". 

In Section 4-A of the Chhattisgarh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhalta Tatha Alnmdm.mt 
Pension Adhiniyam. 1972 (No. 7 of i'973) for the words "One Thousand .. the words Sedion ,t..A. 

"One Thousand Sevan Hundred Fifty., shall be substituted. 

ol 



~ 
--~-qfR~ 3Rflf«~ 
~ ~ ~ 'lj1@11 (fir-u ~ 
fuqrz)t-mtn~-~ 
~-22-0tih-J11i; iraR:/3s fu. ii. 
f~. ~ 30-5-2001." 

~138) 

( difit~l~OI ) 

~~ gi:filfilld 

~.~'~51lt 2010-~ 15, lt<fi" 1932 

~tf afR ~ ffl rci'q)Tf 
l./3ilcl4, ey3) ~ ~ ~. ~ 

~,~3lt{2010 

(,l L) 
-·:.----,-_---· 

-~~ 

·~/09/2010-2012." 

911. 5009/104/21-avID.ro, Tf./10. 0'ffiwr~ ~ ~ ifi1 F1P1ft1f&d ~ f.im '1.R ~ 26-04-201(} cfi1 
~~ ~'!11'8m~t ~~<fil"~~rnv:~~;;J@lt. 

275 

. ' 

0'dlQ•l1f ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ Jil~)(Hjf!H, 

tt. it. 1ffllffl'", "a"q-~-



-··-......_ 

(., L j 
,/ 

276 )II 

um 4 1f;t mmr-r. 

Wffifl'I.; an~ 
(~4'lr-l_2010) 

0'"1e114 ~ll1'T~~, 'fflT~~(~) 

~ 1 201 0 

0'ffl~•lf§ f.nrr-r lNT ~ cliR, \fflT ~ ffi ~. 1972 ( ~ 7 WI_ 1973 ) 

;Jifa:fi{~~~~-

"it:-

2. 

3. 

( 1) ~ ~ dffilM~ fl1tlA ~ ~ ~, '1fflT am ~ (ffl"R) -3#~. 
2010 ttit,clJ~l II. 

~hll{Pt<f Fc.'lR ~ ~ -ihr-J, 'l1'ffl W-IT ihR 31fm;pm, 1972 (~ 7 tfl 1973) ( qj)" 

~ ~ ~ 1E1 ~~~ i!f f.m!! t-) <ii't '-ITTT .3 if,~-~~ ~ m· "ili 
~ 11{ ~"TI@~•~~~-

1i?1 3ifuf.Rrq ~ tU"-a 4 if, ~ 'TI Fill'' ~ ~ 1l{ liiiG ·'-W<J ~· gfn+141fq,., ~ 

~. 

1iR ~ <f>l 1:fm 4-1!1 ll, ~ -~ ~· * ~ 'q"{ ~ ·~ ~; ~ ~ 
-;-;rri), 

WU4-Tl11if~. 5. lfR ~ ~ t1m 4-Tf q,1 ~ <~) i!f, ~ ·--qj-:q m ~- il, "f-2lR ~ ~ •~ 

m l:fifflf' !.1f<1:fl'.!1Flcl ft6<JJ ~. 

~ au~~ qro, ~~ <1) if,~ ''V:<fi~~: m~· ~'fl7A l:Jl~ ·'<h 
~ ~ m'' ~fof\!flMd fq;-.:o ~-

~,~3-qf2010 

ifi. 5009/104/21-3Jlm.f8'. TJ./10.-,;mr-%; ~ t° ~ 348 -t"~ (3) '$~if f:J~tl'l41w.fA'lNI 

~ ~. 1tffl ~ ffi (~) 31f¼f-1t1q, 2010 (~ 4 wt_ 2010) ~ ~ ~ ~ -~ ~ ~ 
~fcfi;;n;;nmt, 

Uffi«'I~ ~ ~ ~ 7fJli ~ 'ff!l1 atla¥11:Ie1(, 

~- 1ft. 'qJ'{J'ffi, oCJ-~. 



CHHATilSGARH ACT 
(No. 4 of 2010) 

_,.,,,.;THE CHHATTISGARH VIDHAN SABHA SADASYA VETAN, BHATTA TATHA 
PENSION (SANSHODHAN) ACT, 2010 

An Act further to amend the Cbhattisgarh Vidhao Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bbatta 
Iha Pension Adhiniyam, 1972 (No. 7 of 1973). 

'. Be it enacted by the Chhattisgarh Legislature in the Sixty-first year of the Republic of 
lhdia as follows:-

(I) This Act may be called the Chhanisgarh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta 
Tatha Pension (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 2010. 

(2) It shall come into force from the date of its publication in the Official Gaiette. 

In Section 3 of the Chhattisgarh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta Tatha Pension 
" Adhiniy am, 1972 (No. 7 of 1973) (hereinafter referred to as the Principal Act) for the 

words "One Thousand Five Hundred" the words "Seven Thousand" shall be substituted. 

In Section 4 of the Principal Act for the words "Five Thousand" the words .. Eight 
Thousand" shall be substituted. 

In Section 4-8 of the Principal Act for the words "One Thousarid" the words "Five 
Thousand" shall be substituled. 

In sub-section (i) of Section 4-C of the Principal Act for the words "Five Hundred 
Ninety Five" the words "Seven Hundred Fifty" shall be substituted. 

In sub-section ( 1 ) of Section 7 of the Principal Act for the words "One Thousand Six 
Hundred Fifly" the words "Two Thousand Five Hundred" shall be substiluted. 

276 ( 1) 

Short title and 
commena:ment. 

Amendment of 
Section 3. 

Amemlment of 
Section 4. 

Amendment of 
S«1:lon 4-B. 

Ameadmcnt of 
Section 4-C. 

Amendment of 
Section 7. 

' ./' / 



-~~%~men 
~~~'ljf@r-T (f.AT ~ 
~~ffl~~-lfil,ffi 
sifl. 2-22-ill'Efltllley tf'ilV38 ft:r. ~­
~' ~ 30-5-2001." 

( 3i~llil~0 I ) 

~~ Ycfilflld 

~~ 

"0~],fil\~/~09/2010-2012." 

~ 139] • ~I~~ 71:ft 2010-~ 17, W:fi 1932 

~~ aft-{ fcNp;ft ffl fcNrrr 
~. ~ cficW,110! ft.hf 'lWI', -~ 

~.~7~2010 

'Ii'. S080/107/21-3IM./iJ. lf.110. sfft:a1fcf ~'ID«~ R"lfo1f&d .3!f'~ ~ l.R ~ 30-04-2010 cli'i 
/~1'ft~m«m~t,~~~~~~~~~t 

\ 

it't1lw,-. ~ ~ ~ ~ "B ~ ati~illt¥4R, 

' it. tit.~,~-~-

277 



278 9'ffiWlq ~, ~ 7 l!l 2010 

0tjlfilj~ ~ 
(~ 7 W'l,2010) 

0tfit4af1' ftmR ~ t4c('4 ~, lf'tlT 'ffffl ~ ( ~) 

~. 2010 

Gifh!i~iiJ ~ ~ ~ffl, ~ ~ 'q\lA ~. 1972 ( ~ 7 lF'( 1973 ) 

q;r3ftr~m~~. 

\ffln ~~~~if ai'fflwii4 ~-llUffl -roll ,f-li-:tf1:1f&t1 ~if~~ 
'ITT:-

( 1) ~ ~ 0tfl~tt1q ~ lNf ~ ~' 'tm n'mffi (tffll1:R) ~. 

2010 cfitRiflq•u. J, 

(2) ~1~2000~~·~. 

mu 6-'lfi' { 1 ) 'tfii 2. {§t(I W j~ rc!lWI 'fNr ~ ffi, 1-fflr iNf ffi an~. 1972 ( ifil:ff<'fi 7 Wf. 1973) <fil mu 
6-<f ( 1 ) ~ ~. 'q ~ 'T<NR ~ %; ~ % qiR!Jl'' ~ ~ ~ "a:!tlqf ~. 

. ~ % 1'iT{!Jf' am:~~~- . 

~.~11ft2010 

. lfi. soa01101121-at~./tf. Tt.110.-'llffl·~ ~ t' ~ 348 t" ~ ( 3) * ~ if mftti~14 flft1'R ~ .. 
~ 'iffR 'lffl ~ffl ~) -lff~. 2010 (sfillTi!fi 7 v-{_ 2010) 'lliJ ~·~ ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ 

' . . . . 

mrf.w.n'-illfflt. 

iJ'ti\wiii ~ ~ '$" -={Jq ~ a1n· 311~,lliYl(, 

. "tt."'!fi.11RWR, ott-~-



m11fl•I~ ~, ~ 7 .:i"t 2010 

CHHATTISGARH ACT 
(No. 7 of 2010) 

THE CHHATTISGARH VIDHAN SABHA SADASYA VETAN, BHATIA TATHA 
PENSION (SANSHODHAN) ACT, 2010 

An Act further to amend the Chhait.isgarh Viclliau Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Dhatta 
Tatha Pension Adhiniyam, 1972 (No. 7 of 1973). 

Be it enacted by the Chhattisgarh Legislature in the Sixty-first year of the Republic of 
India as follows :-

L (1) This Act may be called the Chhattisgarh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta 
Tatha Pension (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 2010. 

(2) It shall come into force from the 1st November, 2000. 

In the s~ond proviso to Section 6-A ( 1 ), of the Chhattisgarh Vidhan Satma Si,.dasya 
Vetan, Bhana r atha Pension Adhiniyam, 1972 (No. 7 of 1973 ), after the words "due to 

· dissolution of Legislative Assembly or" the words "due to resignation or" shall be 
inserted. 

278 ( 1) 

Short title and 
commencement. 

Amendment of 
Section ti-A ( l ). 



-~~ ~ 3'Ril@' :gJq, 

~ ~-PR: '!f«IA (f.r-tt ~ 
~)~mtu~-~ 
~22-@ffi·lil'I~ ~/38 fu. ft 
f'lffl1t, fir-liq, 30-s-2001." 

~166] 

( atfllQl-(01 ) 

~~\lchl~lfl 

~. ~-~ 6 ~ 2011-~ 16, ~ 1933 

~- ~7~2011 

~ 3336/113/21-31/M./D. TT./11. @ffl:(,j•ii¥ ~l1'Tfcfi1. f➔..,!flf&n 81f"t:1f.fqqm-q;: ~03-05-2011 q;)' 

~ "'11 ~'5111(f 1l ~t. ~ ~ 1ffl'~ ~ ft=rtt '5Ai'lftm~ ~ t. 

331 

0ffltt•i4 ~ {liiiQqlel ~ "9tlJ ~ l!'1l' &11~¥ii:!~I<, 

-ai. ~- iiti,iiOft, ~ffiq . 

• 



332 i.9i1h-1•1~ ~. ~ 6 i:it 2011 

=============================·· 
,hilwl~~ 
(""'"" 12 m.2011) 

l§ffi~•·~ fclW'f'l'!m~~. ~~~(~) 
~. 2011 

U'ffiti•lil ia!lRlrm~ffl, ~~'tfiR ~. 1972 (~ 7 ~ 1973) 

..st anr ~,nflra "'"' ~ ~-

( 1) "' ~ @ffie'I~ fq'!R '1'll"""' mFI, ""11l'lT iw-, (ffl'R) iffi-, 
2011 i:f>i.R-1!\QII. 

mi1t1•14~lf'TT~mff, 'J{'ffl'ff~~~. 1912.(~7W£.1973) (~~ 
~ '1'l'iffi\ 'f'I a,f- ii;'"'" f.mfl! %) -.,'\ "1U 6--.;-.,'\ ""'1ro ( 1 ) ii '1a: ''s!l """"" 
if;~ 'll{ ~ '1ITT'ffi' ~· gfaftilf'-1(1 f<fi"l1T ";jffq. 

1F" ~ <fit 'c1RI 6-la i'f ~ '~~•if; liJR ~ ~ "31@ ~R" !Jfl'l'l:'4tf'id ITT" 
.iii. 

'rs - -.it om 6-'1 ii '1-: ''"-"' ,-;w""' -.r· ii; '!'IA 'R '1-: ·,it ,-;w""' -.r· 
',jfoftl1ftrn fr.ti'ln ~. 

""'S', mi;; 7 >ri 2011 

~ 3336'113/21-2,1/!TT.~. TT . .111.-1.TT«l' ~'lffimR' ~ ~ 348 ~~ ( 3) ~ ~iT @:Jltlli~ fonlR 

""' """'-..a, ""'""' iw-1 (mil'R) ~. 2011 <- 12 m_ 2011 l "" 3iir.i\ ~ - ii; 1111\m, -ii 
1')1WU-wu-i. 

0'tl)tltJ'f ~ ~ if; 'l'Jtt ~ ~ 3l!~¥1!jfll(, 

-.;, ""· ""'1'Jft, ---

.•" 



CHHA TTISGARH ACT 
(No. 12 of 2011) 

.._....:THE CHHATIISGARH VIDHAN· SABHA SADASYA VETAN, BHATTA 
TATHA PENSION (SANSHODHAN) ADHINIYAM, 2011 

An Act further to amend the Chhattisgarh Vidhan SabbaSadasya Vetan, Bhatta 
~ Tatha Pension Adhiniyam, 1972 (No. 7 of 1973). 

Be it enacted by the Chhattisgarh Legislature in the Sixty-second year of the Republic 
of India, as follows :-

L 

2. 

3. 

4. 

(I) This Act may be called the Chhattisgarh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta 
Tatha Pension (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 201 I. 

(2) It shall come into force from the date of its publication in the Official Gazette. 

In sub-section (I) of Section 6-A of the Chhattisgarh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, 
Bhatta TatR.a Pension Adhiniyam, 1972 (No. 7 of 1973), (hereinafter referred to as the 
Principal Act) for the words "Ten Thousand" the words "Sixteen lnousand" shall be 
substituted. 

In Section 6-B of the Principal Act, fer the words "five thousand" the words "Eight 
Thousand" shall be substituted. 

In Section 6-~ of the Principal Act, for the words "One lhousand five hundred" the 
words "Two Thousand Five Hundred''. shal\ be substituted. 

332 ( 1) 

Short title and 
commencement. 

Amendment of 
Section 6·A. 

Amendment of 
Section 6--B. 

Amendment of 
Section 6--C. 



-
-~ ~ ~ ~ ~ 

~~~·~ (m ~ 
R<fi~"t ffl tg ~- ~ 
~- 2-22-0-ffif!ll~<r:iR/38 fu. ~­
f'IBlt ~ 30-5-2001 . " 

(~) 

mftrcfrrt* Qc61U,1a 

thfr;R~ 

··<i§i:\h-!'lf1i~f09/20l0-2012.'" 

~ 7-3T] 'Ulf1F, ~ ~- 13 ~ 2012~'tj')-q 23, ~ 1933 

fcn~ ~ fum41 ~ fcf'lWl 
~' ~ ef,fll!Oj ~ ~, ~ 

~ 254/m. 13121-3Vm./w. Tf./12.-milw,~ ful:1Ff 'WTI' q;y f.p'..Cffclraa ~Rff 1:R~ 07-01-2012 

<@' ~ ~ ~ W-0 'ITT¢ t ~I il<h-llt:ll(OI ~ ~ % fuv: 1.J1fiITT@' fff ~ t 

14 ( 1) 

;J'ct1~.-PI~ 4> '{PQ1J@ $° ~ ~ aq'J 3\!{!ltlj«H, 

"it. tit. immt, ~-~-



14 (2) 

@=tih-t11i; alf~ 
(~2lf-{_2012) 

0i11t1•1, ~_'tNf_Q~ ~, ~oPJT'QVA(~-) 
- - -~,: 2011 

&=di~i'i~ faQAmrr~m. \t'ffi'a'$lf?r:t ~. 1972 ( gjfffqi 7 lFI_ 1973 ) -

- qft 3~h fi1t1)fira ~·~ ~-

m:-
,. 

2. 

( 1) ~ ~ @dlwi.: ~ lNT ~ m, ,nu nl!IT -m ('ffiW:R) ~, 

201 l qi(;flt4'1!. 

@'i'11fl•ti; ~~~mR, "1'ffi'W,l'f~~. 1972 (~7lr-( 1973) <tr mu -
4-'IJ ·4rr -aq-~ (~) it, lJliG ~lit~~ ll'fR -er{~ -1mr lfr ~- slf11?-11f.:rn 

~~-

~. ~ 13 ~ 2012 

~ 2541it. 13/21-alf511.ffl. ll./12.-~t-~~ ~ 348 t-~ (3) t- ~ff 0-dhi•I~ ft(~ 

~l-11 ~ i«R. 'l.fffl ~ ffi ( ffli:R) .au~. 2011 (~ 2 ~ 2012) qi]" .:ifr;;n -~~if; 'SITT~ ir ~ 
~~"\@It. 

' 

@'t11+Pii t ~ t" 1P' ll ~ 311~"1:i-EU{, 

-tt. 'dt. 1ffllffl"' "311"-ffl'q'. 



Ci-:iH'-\.ITISGARH ACT 
(No. 2 of 2012) 

''"i'HE U-lHATTlSGARH VIDHAN SABHA SADASYA VETAN, BHATfA 
TA THA PENSIOl\ (SANSHODHAN) ADHINIYAM, 2.011 

An Act further h, amend th(> Chhattisgarh Vidhan Sabha Sadas)"a Vetan, Bhatt a 
Tatha Pension Adhiniyam. 1972 l_l',;o. 7 of 1973). 

B.- ll enacted by thc Cht;auis,c:arh Lcgi\l~ture in the Sixty-second Year ol ths' Rt'.· 
public of !nchc1 ;i~ fol hrn.:5 :---

l. Thi:c:Act miiy he called theOihanisgarh Vidhan Sabha Sada.sya Vetan, Bhatrn 
T.c1th;, Pension (Sanshodh:rn) AJhiniyam. 201 L 

(!:} 1t -,hall co,m: mW force from th-: date of its puh!ication 111 the Offic1Jl 
(_jazeHt:. 

1n ~ub-~c"C!ton !.id o! Secti,.m 4-C of the ChhaHi:\~:arh Vidh:m .Sahha S:ida,y,:i V.::'tdrL 

Bhatta Tatha Pensi~rn Adhiniyam. ! 972 tN!;. 7 ot 1973), for the words: ''hve Hundred 
Ninety five .. !he words "S,.cVt:11 HunJred Fi f1y., :;;hall be SU h,,fi ll\lt:d 

Sh(lrt tith: :rnd 

cnmmeoccment. 

,4 rm: ndmc n 1 

Sediun 4-C 
of 



--

,..I. 

~wt- ~ ~ 
~ t- -:rrre: ~ (R-f/ ~ 
W:R:) ~ ffl ~ 3fTTTf. ~ 
-;,It, 2-22-3i~·i'\w1~ ~/38 rn. ~­
f-..-r(ii'{ ~30-5-2001." 

(aml"mroT) 

~* Qcf;l~ld 

; , ""'-\ 

~ ~ (:-.::~ 
··0 rfl {-1 1li;~/09/2010-2012." 

~206] ~. ~. ~ 1 3flT@ 2012-l;lj]q'UJ 10, ~ 1934 

fclf~ 3frr fcttWft efiT4 ~ 
~. eyai~ ~ ~, ~ 

~' ~ 1 3l7T«'I 2012 

~ 6423M. 110121-3J~ffl. 1T.112.-0tn-8•1~ f<NR ~<Fl F1i=tf<"lfon, ~~ 1R ~ 2s-01-

2012 cm~ qil ~ m'<l wt~ t ~ ~ qil ~ ~ ~ ~-F<mr ~ t 

411 

0t1l-8•I~ "t" ~ t' ";:[Tq iJ i'l'<l"I 3ll~WjilR, 

"°%. ~. iH41Ufl, ~~-

..... 

\ 



412 
, I 

0tlltt•t~ ~~ ~ 1 _~ 2012 

0"C"1"1{ttll:4 3lf~ 
(~15~2012} 

@ii1H•J4 ~fli:H4 ~, 'ffif~~(~) ~ 
~,2012 

G'iflfil1¥ ~lNf~i@;f. \lmnWT'QlA' ~, 1972 ( ~ 7 ll';,.1973 ) 

qi)-~miitft@~mt~ 

,crl._ "'. 

(1) ~3if~ m1lt1i1~ F-\'i::!Rw:tl~~, \ttl'IWTTffl(~) ~. 

2012 <h$i.:1l~•n. 

(1) f~ fcf~ ~'>TT~ mrf, '1m W-l1 ffi 31f~, 1972 (~ 7 m_ 
1973 ), <~ ~ ~ ~ ~ 31f~ ~~if~ l) <f>1 l:l1U s-cfi" tfft 
"Jq-mu < 1) (1211 m '51?.fll ~ it, ~ ·-m ~ cmsr· ~ ~ ~ ~ ·~ 
m::rB"ref'"Sif~ ~~. 

(2) ~ 3lf'~cfil mu s-cfi"cft~-mu (2} "G', ~ ~~"ffi"&' *~~ 

~ "~ ~ r:l'IBf ~ ~· ~ ~ ~-

wr 3if~<f>1 irru 6-cfiq,1-ait-tmr < 1) ~>lilB ~if.~ ·~m ~· %~~ 
~ ''cTA ~ ffl' ~ ~ ~ ·a:m: ~ "~ ffl ,:ft~·~~~ 
"a:m: <ffl' \ft fcti' ~ Tcfim ~ ~ ~ ~ "B ~ clll ~~ m ~ ~if <fil<f 
f<tim m, m -"3"it ~ q-q "B '$1R ~ ~ c.nt ~~~mm~ amrt't<ffi ~ cfr 
~ a'fR * ~ c7.lfi:@ ~ ~crf ';I aw.ffi ~ <61e1lqftl in~~ ~-q' qifq nfi<TT 
m, m "3"it ~ cftl i1 ~~ ~ ?f'.f ~ fuQ. 'qfi:f mm~ 3ITTlft<ffl~<fr ~,, 
~~-

1!.8 mf.rrq <fft mu 6-19; ~ 'fl!l.'r-1 lH f1l--if(1fon1 -em:r ~~ ~, ot~ :­

·~~ ~ ~ ~~'ttftlf1:l'WI *~ 11', <fit ~~ffl 3fflflcfiT, w cfEf 
cfil~Q~~. oTI~cfil1RJ~~~~~•~m~~~-" 

~. ~ 1 wmt 2012 

~ 6423tit. 110121-ot~./U. "11./12.-'ITI'ffl ~ ~ ~ ~ 348 -t-~ (3) "t-~ if·e'Clltt•I~ 

~~~mr-1', \Rff~ffl (~) ~. 2012 (mq; lSWl.2012) <fir~ ~~"t°mf\ffi"R 
~~~mt 'afRlt t. 

mihM~ -t-~ "t' 'if'l'f * "f't1 a11(wi1e1<, 
"i5. ~ 1Rq1oft 1 ~~-

---



I 
! 
j 

i 

I 

. :- "\ 

1~ 

CHHA TI1SG~ ACF 
(No. 15 of 201i) ' 

THE CHHA1TISGARH VIDHAN S~HA SADASYA VETAN, BHATIA 
TA TIIA PENSION (SANSHODHAN) ADHINIY t\M, 2012 

· • An Act further to amend the Chbattisprh. Vidb,~ ~,SAdasya Vet.an, Bbatta 
Tadaa Pension Adhiniyam, 1972 (No, 7 ot 1973). · 

Be it enacted by the Chhattisgarh Legislature in the Sixty-thiid Year of the Republic 
,ef India, as follows :_._ · 

f 

. , 
• 

2. 

3. ' 

4. 

(1) 

(2) 

(I) 

I 

This Act may be caJled the Chhattisgarh Vidhan Sabha ~ya Vetan, Bhatta 
Tatha Pension (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 2012: · · ' 

It shall come into force from the date of its. publication in the Official 
Gazette . 

In sub-section (1) and its first proviso of Section 5-A of the Chhattisgarb 
Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta Tatha Pension Adhiniya, 1972 (No. 7 
of 1973), ( hereinafter referred to as the Principal Act) for the words 
"Rs. Two Lac" the words "Rs. Three Lac" shall be substituted. 

(2) In sub-section (2) of Section 5-A of the Principal Act, for the words 
"Rs. One Lac" the words "Rs. One Lac Fifty Thousand" shall be substituted. 

In the first proviso to sub-section ( I) of Section 6-A of the Principal Act, for the 
words "two hundred rupees" the words ''three hundred rupees" shall be substituted 
and after the words "in excess of five years" the words ''and if any person has served 
as aforesaid for a period exceeding ten years there shall be paid to him an additional 
pension of four hundred rupees per mensem for every year in excess of ten years and 
if any person has served as aforesaid for a period of more than fifteen years there shall 
be paid to him an additional pension of five hundred rupees per mensem for every 
year in excess of fifteen years:" shall be added. 

For Section 6-B of the Principal Act, the following Section shall be substituted, 
namely:-
'There shall be paid a pension of rupees ten thousand per mensem to the spouse, if 
any for life or to a dependent of a member or ex~member for a period of fifteen years 
from the date of his death." 

Short dde and 
commencunent. 

Amendment 
SectioGS,A. 

Amendment 
Section 6-A, 

Amendment 
Section 6-B. 

or · 

or' 



I 
I_ 

a 

•. 
' 'r -, 
\, 
. -..,.: 

·#> 
, ..... 
.. --·~~ ~· 3Rt7@' ~' 

~*~ 'ljl@A (f.RI ~ 
rofi?)~ffltl~-~ 
~-22-ihih-111,; ,r-;gt38 ra. 'R. 
f(;;t, ~ 30-5-'2001." 

~~ 
. illme•iq~/09/2012-2015." 

0tflt111rs <1'114~ . . . . -♦- . .· - ... · -· . . . 

~153) ~. ~. ~ 1s • 2013-b 2s, ~ !935 

·M'lafrl~~~ 
~.~~ •. .pf(~. 

~ 3025/it. 109/21-at'JIRii./B. 1'\.113.-'ifift_,e,ti.l?NA lNJ <61 f1Liff€1fl!id arr~ :f.im" lJ{ ~ 08-04-

2013 ifiT ~ "'1 ~ mta-1': ¢t. ~- 0461'«~1 ~. ~ * ~~-f<nln-"ffffl.t. . . 
. .. . - . . .. 

if<ft.Wlq .~~ ~ 1111·1': ~1 341~1:JtlR, 
· ~-~ au11uft, ~ ~-

.; .-·.~i-·. 

305 

.. 

. ' . ~-

• 



• 

306 

• 

9'tfiwFt ~. ~-,s d'A 2013 

''·· 

• 

.. tftw1,; ~ 
(JIOll,o; 11 "1'1'(2013) 

.,..a .. ,,.,~ .. , ~ ~. ~'ffl!{f~ < .i,n....,. > 

' 
.~,2013 

eillll•r, 1l1,wnnin111'l'I...,, •mn1111~ "lid'!"•• 1912 (15>rii5 ,...,_ 1913) 
"16T afR ~ ffl «11 a,filf'lqq, . ' 

1. 

2. 

3. 

IDU4"1il'~ 4. 

IIRf 4-'15' 'itil'lffitn, 5. 

·' 
!ffll''4--11-#R. 7. 

8. 

( 1) ~ 3'fqf.14r1,-e~ilw141hFr lf'U~ ~. i@rnl!lfffi (Wffl\H) atfllf.1411, 
2013 Qdt<Q•it· 

.. .i~i,~ 1lNI'! l!'!l - ffl, ""111'11 ffi a,rtif••·· 1972 (-7 "'f. 1973 ), (ail. 

WT ~ w,rni: 'f" airtif.1◄• ..- ""'ii~ tJ "" '1RT , ..- .,.. (,rJ ..- w,rni: 
r .... r~m ,m onit, .....,. :-. ~"' 

"i"' airtir .... ,., ""' 3 ii - . ..,,. .,.,. ....,_, ..- """ "' ""' .. ~ i! i.r1f,{,," 
SIRl~1flffl M ~ . 

..... 3ffilf➔<1q ,.'\· '1RT 4 ii - .. .,., 'RR....,. *""" Sl'. - .. ~if~-
ifdt111fqa ~~- · 

,.., >irtif••• ..a . ..u ~-.,;ii""' ""-"' 1"ffl ""'m m '""""'~ "llifil'• ~ ...., "''II'![ 

"~ ii f•~ <ifw i:t~·· •f•••nf.1• 1lfisronit. 

'{cl 3ffilfllqq ,.\ ""'4,~if- '""".PIR ffl STIPIIJ ,.\ ,:{lf' *"!IA s;: "~ if 
fdlf•il'& · S1@flt1f.:ltt f~ 'i!N. 

"" .,r>,r.,.., :'l\t,ro •-.,.'i"'li -.rn 'Ull'I: ·-.mm'l'lmm..t ~.r """'.m..-­
"' - .. ~ ·ii f!lf➔~•-"fa~lf•• 11,;,,J ~-

'1,1:1 a,flllaqq ,i;t ""' 7 .:I 1'J-'1RT ( 1 ) if - •~ PIR '""' '1ft ffl '"1" <\' 'l'IA Sl'. -
..~if~· ,m...!li. ~-.nit. 

• 

• 

..?-
,, 

i 



--
f, 
V 

. -

_,.:: _ --- · uiile•1q ~.-~ t~ .-2013 · 
======================================== 306 (1) 

. 9. 

-.. :fl. . 

. . . 

- 1Fi o1Nf14q <ift m-10 ~~~Ht. F1"1f(i-lf8it ~ ~ "GJPl, ~ :-

t:nu 

(1) 

mu3 
'11U4 
1:1RT4-q, 

'-im 4-11 

'-im4-"tf 

lTTU7(1) 

-. 3t:J~iil C :' . . 

J 1:1RT 2(lt) ~] _ .· - -

~-~-~ 
. ~-llil ~ ffi" mu 
~'ffll 
~-'fflf_ 

~ 'ffll 
~lr'UlfTT-~~llfi:lftrifit­
-~if111'T~<61~~. 

'lffl. 

~-~ f"'4f.a-ti '4m 

... '.•,t~ . - . 

. ·.'-

-_- ->- ~~_1sa11R2013 
- . ·-'.:I ,· 

. .. I ~ 

. 'Om 
(3) 

m 1.0,000~ 
m is.ooo~ 
'"61A 3,000 11fflim::r" 
m 10,000 1iftmm 
m _1so~ 
~ -750~ 

- _. ~ . 

-·. --·301m,. 109121-a1,~1~.11f'1ti11-~ *~ .-~ ~ ~•l!N-(03)·~-•~ -ij-----_ -

NIIA w1rC~Zf1WJ.1Rtr.lPlm <~t:aat11PNG. 1013 csa 111Fl_2013) ·1'il ~ ~~~~ -
-0~~-i'P!:i'ilRllt'.-. . -

rit1114 l\" "{fllAlff ~ ~,11nl <11r1 aubu:(EtR. 
-_ .. ._ ..... 11.~~ 

. ,,. 



306 (2) 

CHHA TI1SGA}W ACT 
(No. 11 of 2013) 

THE_ CHHAITISGARH VIDHAN SABHA SADASYA VETAN, BHATIA TAnfi:.;.,• 
PENSION (SANSHODHAN) ADHINIY AM, 201.3 

An Act further to amend.the Chbattisgarh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatia 
-Tatha Pension Adhiniyam, 1972 (No. 7 of 1973). 

· . Be it enacted by the Chhanisgarh Legislature in the Sixty-Fourth Year of the 
Re-public of Iruha, as follows. : -

Short . tffle and . I . (1) This Act may be called the_Chhattisgarh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhaua 
Tatha Pension (Sansttodhan) Adhiniyam, 2013. colllDKDttllKDt. 

Amendment 
· Stttlon 2. 

Amendment 
Section 3. 

Aroendmeut 
s«tiot14. 

Amendment 
Section ,t..A. 

Amm.dment 
s«tion 4-B. 

Amendmut 
s«tlon+c. 

or 2. 

.. 
of 3. 

of 4. 

of 5. 

of 6. 

of 7. 

of 8. 

~ · lmutlon of Schedule. 9. 

(2) It shall come into force from the date of its publication in the Official 
Gazette. 

After clause ( c) of Section 2 of the Chhattisgarh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta · 
Tatha Pension Adhiniyam, 1972 (No. 7 of 1973) (hereinafter referred to as the Princi­
pal Act), the following shall be added, namely :-

"(d) "Schedule" means a Schedule appended to this Acr." 

In Se.ction 3 of the Principal Act, for the words ··of Seven Thousand rupees per mensem" 
the words ··as specified in the Schedule" shall be subslituted. 

.. 
In Section 4 of the Principal Act, for the words "of Eight Thous.and rupees per nrensem" 
the words "as specified in the. Schedule" shall be substih!led. 

In Section 4-A of the Principal Act, for the words "'One Thousand Seven Hundred 
Fifty per mensem" the words .. of an amount as specified in the Schedule"' shall be 
substituted. 

In Section 4~ B of the Principal Act, for the words •:Five Thousand rupees per mensem~ 
the words ··as specified in the.Schedule" shall be substinned. -

In Section 4-C of the Principal Act, wherever occure the words .. at the rate of rupees 
Seven Hondred Fifty peroay" the words •·as specifie.d in the Schedule" shall be substi­
tuted. 

In Sub-section (I) of Section 7 of the Principal Act, for the words "of Two Thousand 
Five Hundred per mensem·• the words ··as specified in the Schedule" shall be 
substituted. 

After Section JO of the Principal Act, the following Schedule :shall be added, 
namely:-

Section. 
(I) 

Section 3 

"SCHEDULE. 
[ See Section 2(d)] -

_Pay/Allowai:i,ce Particuhu: . 
'(2} . • . 

Salaries of members -

Amount_ 
_·{~} 

. ·Rupees tO,OOO·per ·.·· 
mensem 

Section 4 Constituency-allowance for memben · Rupees 25.CKX) per ~_" 
mensem 

. -• 

---

. . . 

! 
T 
I 

I 



"' l!ll'ffi·ttiil ~; ~.15 ~ 2013 ~ 
306 (3) 

. . . 

,I'~ -·.:: 

(1) (2) (3) 

·~ Section 4-A Telephpne allowance Rupees 3,000 per 
.mensem 

Section 4-B Ardali allowace Rupees 10,000 per 
mensem 

Section 4-C D•ily Allowance Rupees 750perday 

Additional daily allowances for Rupees 750 pc;rday -• attending the meeting of Vidhan 
S~ or meeting of Committees. 

" Medical allowance to ·me,nbers Rupees 4,500 per r- - Section 7 (1) 

~ merisem•• 

a 

.,,. 

~. ~cl'ff 'Mr-tlfflnlt, ~ll'UlllffPI' ~~. W=rit:11iq.1'~ aa!f J1llfilft@-2013.· , 
. . . ~ . . . 



.. 
• I ,. 
·~~~ ar-aita~ 
~ % ~ lj1@R (f.ifn ~ 
fzifil)~mi'§~. lfi1ff!ti 
~r~22-,'dla•Rf 1RZJ381ll t. 
~. ~ 30-5-2001." 

~ 183 ] 

( ~flllU-tU I ) 

~ 1J Qq,I ~Id 

~. ~. ftr-rilf; 6 llf 2013-bRI 16, llqi 193S 

fclN afR fiit.114' ~ fq,wJ 
ti':41(14, qg..,.~ ~ • .p;n ~ 

~~6~2013 

,· o::;) 
. ') / 

. ~-. _.,,., 
1 . ~ sfill'fcfi 
·"U'iftt1• 1i;,~109no12-201 s ... 

Rifi' 3685/l!\. 120/21-31'~. 11./13.-M\l•II fiftwf lNPJit P-t..:,fc1tf&d anlif-14q f,;m' 'ql ~ 26-04-

201315) ~ lfft' ~ lW(f Tt ~ t, ~ ftdtiilli{~ ~ ~ $ ftt'{ vi6lftm fil;ln ~ t. 

365 

9\ftt:M4 _, (i\itNit'I $ 'IPf t '""' au~¥11i441<, 
~1fflta. 3'ftlftwa~. 



366 

0\fl(l•l;p dIT'lR'lll 
(- 16 <f\2013) 

0ffiij•l;p fcM'r lNI fh;fll ~. 'ffiT <tm ,lffi ( fflU'!) 
~.2013 

.! 

0'ifm211 faQRwm~ctR. \fiffc111fim-J, ~. 1912 ( 'ifi1tiq;: 7lf;y_ 1973) 

.aaftr~,m-t;i~ 

m,-
1. 

2. 

(1) ~ ""'"""" "'"""~ f•'"""'"-""'· ""'""'il>R (mn>R) -· 
201:":! <i,Wi:11~•11. 

' ' 
@ffit111~ f<NR~~c1tR. 'llffl(l'llihf-f otNf.:1.q-4, 1912 (~7lFl_ 1973) ctrr 'lRT 

6-TJ-if~•'t~~lfr• '%;ll(R~~•~~• Slfnfilllfl:m f~~-

Jlilli;. 3685t>ft. 120/21-~- 'J./13.--%~-.;-~ 348-.;-...,,.. (3) % ar:!'R"I ii ..... " 
f>NR-...--..., ""'""'il>R (~) -. 2013 (.,.,.,.. 16 W1_2013) «iF<ilr.ft - """""'., ffl'liR 
.t~-i.ra--t. 

U'fl\QIJi; ~---~ % ~ 'Q° of.II 3tla:jlriffl{, 

. ·-.---.~--



vi 

CHHATfISGARH ACT 
(No. !6 of 2011) 

THE CIIIIAITISGARII VIDIL\N SABHA SADASYA VET,\'.\/, BHATTA 
TA THA PENSION (SANSIIODHAN} ADIIINIYAM, 2013 

An Act further to amend the Chhattisgarh Vidhan SabhaSadas)a Vetan, Rhatui 
Tatha l'~·nsion, AdhiniJam, l'J72 (No. 7 of 1973). 

He !l cnach:J by !he C!1hJll!,g;irh Legislature in the Sixly-founh 1\'.ar of the 

Rqmhl1c of India :1s follows ---

I. ( 1 ) This Ac! may he called the: Chhattisg.irh V1dhan Sahha Sadas;a Vctan, Bhatt.it, 
Tatha Pens1un (S,1nshodhan) Adhin1yam, 2013 

(2) le .\hall corrn: into force from the date of its puhlica11011 in the official 
g;uctlc. 

In Scc1ion 6-C of the Chhattisgarh Vidhan Sabha Sad as ya V ctan, Bhatta Tatha 
l'cusion, Adhmiyam, 1972 (No. 7 of 1973), for the words "Two Thnusand Five 
Hundred" the words "Ten Thnu.,and" shall be substituted. 

366 (I) 

-------·-- ~---· 
~. ~ ~ ~ lftln'H, ~ ;Rl ~ ipP.I ~4, {l◄-tie;•lii:i 8 ~ <I'll 'Rilffra-2013. 



.~ ·~~*~~~t 
'ffl !r@i-1 ( ~ ~ fz<R: ) * ~ 
tJ, ~-~ "it.2-12-~ 

1liR I 1s fu-. ~- ~. ~ 
39-05-ZOOI." 
..,r 

~175] 

(alttl\11{01) 

SU~cfil( ~ Ycfili1td 

~~ 
·~(lri;o,/201J-201s." 

============-~=-=-==-=----=---=============~--

.. 

wigt, ~ 2'. 2016 

~a1211/'it. ua1/2t-31[im-:./1J.11./16 -~fum-1:m:rr<:r"A'"'R-i~"' ~i;;m~~ 12-04-2016 ~ 
~ 1"fiT ~JIT(ff m ~ t, ~l +:14,Mi\.Cf(lll cfl"~ t f#,1t.!'Si<fiff~l"<'f ff:m ~ t. 

~t,~~~~<fm ~iel:!iiifll{, 

,ct. +;, l@l. ~ ~-

]49 

" 



3SO 

..... =====::....:_:_:· :.:::·--::..:·:.:::-··-=-="-======-============== ------

lffi1 6-'fi ilil 

li m ti ar . 

lffi1 '"'1 'l>T 

ll''?!i'Fl. 

~;ii_,j\ ofll 

.-:mv.i. 

, 

0Rflt=111~ ~ 
(1fiJl'Ril7~)01li) 

iiii'ifltfllll ~~ tnTI ~ ffl, lffil (!'QT ffl aiftlf.,iqq, 197l (Ji'. 7 ~ 1!73) lf>1 
~ ~ ~ ~ ~f.i4ii. 

.l 

4 

!, 

(I) ~ ~ ~fum-lmn ~ iffl-r. '1m ~ ~ ~) ~. 2016 

~-

(H 

~ filvRmn~¼..-1, w.!Tcfl!ll~~- I'm (;J;, 7 ~J'P3), (;irf,:lii~~­
~ :.ribf.raR * ,.:-q ~ 1'1 f!g_ ~ J, <it qm 5 -Cf. it. · 

(!f.li} 3'Q-'1R1 0/ it. ;,itjifil,l lft~ •~,mi <'l'F?J" 3!titm ii;~ q;,_ ~ "~ii,P.n 
~,, '!lf.wJm'<ff.t.m'JITTI: am 

(>ii) :JQ•tm:T \2) ii,~ "i,; ~ -.:r,ira -r,,m" 'iEWTifm- ~ .. ~ii -a•JT ~" 
11f.=t(,11:tlfu>i f.f.m 'JIT!f_ 

If! ~if.1~6-if>-if:JQ-tm:Jil Jih~"~~-m-a~" ~~m-q,:, ~ ·'~ 

-q "'l<fl ~ ~ ~ fiF'l1 ::,rri.f _ 

~ ~-#.!Qm 6-.Jli. ~ ·~n-r:"f.'(T'it~" it.WRT-R. Wi!:: "~ iimrrfu-f.w.B"'' 
~ fit.'1T .m)_ 

..~ 
[ti'@ Zftl')~J 

---~,-~ ~~-
ffl/ffin<f;l mt 

fir.:roi1 
(t) (2) (3) (4) 

~<filmr-1 ~20,000~ 

Z. l..w.J 4 ~*fi:ii!R<ITTR ~JO,UOO~ 

1$1 lfifl. 

3. tm:r 4-ii\ ~lIBI ~ 5,000~ 

~~ ~15,000~ • 



...J· 

~mrof. ~29~2016 350 (I) 
-----·-------------------

---~---
(I) 12) Oi (~) 

s. trm 4-11' (f[<fi) #;.t;lfn! CTFE) ffliJ I, 000~ _, 

(-ii) f<NR m.i cf.tffl:! 
"l!l~';/;'t~ Ii lUIT 

~~ ~ffi"ifi lral 

6. um Ff" /1) ~i,;i¥J7,;r~arr:n.i ,;qi: 4,011,IIOO ~ 

mm 

7. ORT s-~ (2) w~~m~~ ~2.00,000~ 

~m;n 

I! . Uro 6-if. I J) it.Ir-, ~ 10,000 JffimIB 

9. tmf 6-11' w~~m~ ~15,0un~ 

"Q:;fT 

rn. !J"m7(1) ~~f.:rofu%,mlfilT ~ w.oon~ '' 
-~------. ----,--- -----

~-~ 29 -~ 2016 

~ 4?28/it. t44/21-a1/1JW-./U. ll./16. --lfmft~t ~ 34gif,'llJ'Ti IJ)it ~~~ ~~ 
i!lt-H:ilWif> ~~ 29-04-2016,t;J ~ ~~t~if~~ ~~~-

~~~ it; -l"T+!"f!iim sil)~l!l ljfll• .. 

~~-~-~<Fl~-" 



I 

350 (2) 

;,- ',==-==============C'"'."""==::-:::c:==::-:::::c-:::c:::::-~-::::--::::-:-:c-:--:::--:::-===:=--::::::=== 

Shon litfo 

AmtHdmenr 
Scrfi<tn S-A. 

Amr11dm~nt 
Se( 1io ,1 6-.-\. 

,;~ 

.\u1~nd mtn1 
St ,·t ion 6-C. 

-\ m ,·ml m e111 
:-.,·h(dolt. 

CHHATTISGARH ACT 

(No. !7of20J6) 

TH[ CHHATTISGARH \'!OHAN SABHA SA DASYA VETAl'i. BHATIA TATHA 
PENSIO~ ( SM~SHODHAN) ADHINIYAM, 2016 

An Acl further to amend the Chhattisgarl1 Vidhan Sabha S1tdasya Vetan, Bhatta 
Tl!lha PensionAdhiniyam, 1972 (No. 7 of 1973), 

He it enacted by the Chllat1isc1:arh Legi,Jarure in the Six1y-s.:n:mh Ytar of tht• Repuhlic 
of India. as foll01~, :-

and L 

or ,., 

or 3. 

of -4, 

or 5. 

S. No. 

( 1) 

l. 

?. 

.1. 

4. 

(I) 

(2) 

This Ac-1 may be cal led the Chhim isgarh Vidhan Sabh:i 5J.da~ya Vetan. Bhan a 
Tatha Pension (S,mshodhan) ,\dhini}mJ. 2016. 

!1 shall come in!o forn· from the Jate ofi1s publi,at ion in the Official Ga,-:cnc. 

111 Section ."-·A of the Chharti;gnrh \'idhan Sabha ':>w:lasya Vetan. Bhatia T::itha Pension 
Adhiniyam. I 9-72 ('.'.o. 7 or I 9-,J J. (hereinafter referred to a, the Principal A en.-

ii) in suh-secrion ( ! ). ti.lr the wurds ··Rs. Three Lac··, wherever they ocnir, 1hc 
word~ ·•as 5pe.:itied in the Schedule'" ;hall be subslitllted: and 

Oi) in ~ub-s1..--ction (2), for the words ·'Rs. One Lac Vifiy Thousaml", the words .. a, 

specified in the Scheduk' shall be ,ubstituted · 

In sub-section { I J ufSec1iou 6-A 0f the Principal Acl. for tht ,~ords ··SixlL-cn lhousanu 
ruptts per mcnsem", th<' words ··l'ls specifit."d in the Schedule" shall he suhs1ituted. 

In Sedion 6-C of the Principal Act. for th1.e word, ··Ten thOLis:md rupees per month'". 
the word~ "as spedfied in the ~chedule .. ~hall be substituted. 

For 1h.- existing Sd1edule. the followinr ~hall be- substituted. namely :-

··SOIF.Ol ILE 

I Sec Seciion :! (d) I 
-.. -- -- --~- ··-- -· -~~ ~- .. -

Section Pay.,·,, ilowancc Amount 

Particular 
(2) (]J (4) 

-- ~~-~~----~-

Section 3 Sl!laries of Member Rupees 20,000 
permcnse-m 

Section 4 Constituency allo1,-antt Rupees 30.000 
torme-mber. permensem 

Sert ion 4-A Telephone allowance Rupees 5,D00 
perm,msem 

Section-I-A Ardali allowance Rupees l 5,000 
permenscm 



..r 

~~- ~29~21116 35110) ===~======---=c._:::;:....:::-:=====· -~-----··; ~ ---------------=----

----•--•- •-•-~---~••-••--~•--•-•--••"••••--••••~•--••• •"h-•-~•-••••-••p 

(I) {2) 

Section4-C 

6. Secfi()n 5-A\ I ) 

" I, St:l..1ion 5-A(2) 

8. £eel iou 6-A( J ) 

9. Section 6-C 

10. Socticin 7( J i 

(3) 

(i) Dailyal!owance 

(ii) Additional daili allowance 
for attending !he mee1ing of 
Vidhan Sabha or meeting of 
CC1mmittees. 

R~tl :ind A irTravet for mt·mbcN 

Rail and Air Travel for ex­
mcmbt:rs 

Ptns.ion 

Medical allowance for ex­
members. 

Medical a!Jm1,.:mce m members 

(4) 

(i) Rupees. 1.000 
per day 

(li) Rupees 1,000 
per day 

RL!pees 4,00,000 
per year 

Rupees 2.00,000 
Pla'r year 

Ru~-cs '.!0,000 
permensem 

Rupee<; 15.000 
l)c'r rn cnsem 

Rupees 10,000 
pc.•r men se m :· 

• 



'ffi€ fi-€ t en<rfa er+ ga*
ilrE gmn(futr ersE{-s)+ isol

fu q-gffi xqia S.z-zz-ffic
rrwa / rs fr. t. ffi, frais
3o-05-2ool."

rifu{x,ci*
'ffi/gf/ otIzors-zors."

ffi{|\rtrtEt
(wqrqruUr)

mknn t ffirftd

ircis 44s l vagr,frren,ftqi* zrfutrwt 2020- sTIk{ o,rrfi rsaz

fde sft furS q'd tctil:l
ri{IFtq, FdrA qEFT, ;t IT {rilgt sr@ rFR

wram, ftqi* zlfraqt zozo

xcifi zzsrlS. rnrlzr-orffi.le..tt.Ito.-ofufrqner+rorffifuasTfuftqcfu€qrfrri* 21-6e-rmo6
tr-squra fi aq{fr qr< d gff t, v+qanr vdurtmur ff vrT*.rt + ftN lr*lfrn frqr urdr t.

vfuT e t rrqqrat ;rm QaQn s{raqngqR,

sftr gm CI,rfuI, Erftkfi qPdc.

889



890 udqrErlqq{, frqi6 2s fuilqr 2o2o

sftflvirq sTftrfuq
(mcis rsvtzozo)

E*qIc frqrq qqt vqs icr, tr*r aert ikm tffiml
srft[F[qq, zozo

Bfrrd frtrn sm v(g iilq, IliIT aQrr {sri qfufrqc, ,972 lfi. z rrl tczr) {
sfrc t{iri 6d tg ef{fr{c.

rma rrunrq * E*-{fli q{ i Bfu ft qlq qtrsa arrn fcETft rfud sq fr qc erft rffid B : -

-;rrf, aql 1. (r) ues{fufucvdqlr6ftqnsqrv{s*ffi,rranaartq{H R{silfi1erfrftqq, 2626

urtc. E6-d*rn

12) rcnqq*ifs+r+rcri*ilft€nrr{a$n.

ErRr 6-rr an riciw. 2. BdsrqftqnqtTlv{qid{,trtaefiq{nqelfufi,tgtzE..7lrtte73), $Esirq+qgrq
{d srfufuq t w i fttrs t) fr, qnr o-ui, rreE'!ftrn€<qEsntqi " **emqt, {rq
"wgqff i uw frftfu " vfuPnfud frqrvd.

er{qqt or drrim. 3. fge&fuci,wgqfft,vraa;ctso, zGr aqr ssfr {teik uEfrEi * *qn qt, FrIg:

ffifua ufuqrfud fuqr vrn, srarfE : -

(1) (zl (3) (4)

"6. qRr s-6 (r) v+gl t ftrA td \,?i rqia,oo,ooovfud
equnuxfrfuvfra.

7. qrtl s-6 (2) tKlTfv€i+ffitdqE wil,oo,ooovFrq{
EqurqurrrdrEneftd.

8. snn 6-i[ (1) frsri wi:s,ooouftcrs

8i5. ErRr 6-rr ffiv<eurrnrqfv<s* Fqi2s,000sft{rs"
qfr/qd,qRet$d,*1
e{lsfr+1q1gq+sTrflrd+1
qqtq{ffqrarq&tftri,
wvcsfiTg+ffi-6e
q{rcAsftft.

waar,r, ft<io znfurwr zozo

*qio zzsrl$. rar/zr-er/urs.la.tlzo.- tnra*{fri{q+ er-g-+q rle+ Eus (l) } ogvruti6eftmlut
qr{iq6 er&fu{ frqi{ z l - s - z o z o oT eim wgqrE rr*tqrfr ft srkfi e qd{dnr u-+Rn fr qr qrar t.

sfu * nqqra* <miaw wtvrgvn,
snu grrn ulfrsr, erfttm qfu{.



, frii628frdwr2o2o seo (r)

CHHAITISGARH ACT

(No.15of2020)

THE CHHATflSGARH YIDHAN SABHA SADASYA YETAN, BHATTA TAIIIA

PENSTON (SANSHODHAN) ADHIMYAM, 2020

AnActfurtherto amend theChhattisgarh Vidhan Sabha SadasyaVetan,Bhatta Ththa
Pension Adhiniyam, 1972 (No.7 of 1973).

Be it enacted by the Chhattisgarh Legislature in the Seventy-First Year ofthe Republic
oflndia, as follows :-

l. (l) This Act may be called The Ctrhattisgarh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Short title and
commencement.Bhatta Tatha Pension (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 2020.

@ It shall come into force from the date of its publication in the Official Gazette.

2. In the Chhattisgarh Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta Tatha Pension Adhiniyam, Amendment of

1972(No. 7 of 1973), (hereinafter referred to as the PrincipalAct), inSection Section 6-8'

6-8, for the words o'rupees ten thousand per mensem ", the words " as specified in
the Schedule " shall be substituted.

3. In the Principal Act, in Schedule, for serial number 6, 7 and 8 and entries relating thereto, Amendment of

the following shall be substituted, respectively, namely :- schedule'

(1) 0)

o'6. Section5-A(1) Rail and Air Travel for Rupees8,00,000peryear

Members with Boarding.

7. Section5-A(2) RailandAilTravelforex- Rupees4,00,000peryem

members with Boarding.

8. Section6-.4.(1) Pension . Rupees 35,000 per mensem

8 A. Section 6-8 There shall be paid a pension Rupees 25,000 permensem."

to the spouse, if any for life
or to a dependent of a

member or ex-member for a
periodof fifteen years from
the date of death of the
member.

(4)(3)

darrc,guaueqiqrffrn,y+qJrqamvrs$quisndq,TEI{rqg{q-trdirmQgBaaaIIn-6lRrd- zozo.



“

 
 “ ”





CHHATTISGARH   ACT

(No. 12 of  2022)

THE  CHHATTISGARH  VIDHAN   SABHA   SADASYA  VETAN,  BHATTA  TATHA

PENSION  (SANSHODHAN)  ADHINIYAM,  2022.

An  Act further  to amend the Chhattisgarh Vidhan  Sabha  sadasya vetan, bhatta tatha
pension Adhiniyam, 1972 (No. 7 of 1973).

Be it enacted by the Chhattisgarh Legislature in the Seventy-third  Year of the Republic
of India, as follows :-

1. (1) This   Act   may  be  called  the  Chhattisgarh  Vidhan  Sabha  Sadasya  Vetan,
Bhatta Tatha pension  (Sanshodhan)  Adhiniyam,  2022.

(2) It shall Come into force on the date of its publication in the Official Gazette.

2. For   the  entries  relating  thereto of serial number 1, 2, 3, 5 and 10 of Schedule of the
Chhattisgarh  Vidhan  Sabha  Sadasya  Vetan,  Bhatta  Tatha  Pension  Adhiniyam, 1972
(No. 7 of 1973), the following entries shall be substituted, namely:-

Amendment of
Schedule.

Short title and
commencement.

(1) (2) (3) (4)

“1.

2.

3.

5.

10.

Section 3

Section 4

Section 4-A

Section 4-C

Section 7(1)

Constituency
allowance for Members

Salaries of Member

Telephone
allowance

Daily
allowance

Medical
allowance for Members

Rupees 20,000
per mensem

Rupees 55,000
per mensem

Rupees 10,000
per mensem

Rupees 2,000
per day

Rupees 15,000
per mensem”













 



 

fof/k vkSj fo/kk;h dk;Z foHkkx 

ea=ky;] egkunh Hkou] uok jk;iqj vVy uxj 

 

uok jk;iqj vVy uxj] fnukad 17 tuojh 2025 

 

Ø- 622@Mh- 03@21&v@izk:-@N-x-@25- & NRrhlx<+ fo/kku lHkk dk fuEufyf[kr vf/kfu;e] ftl ij 

fnukad 01&01&2025 dks jkT;iky egksn; dh vuqefr izkIr gks pqdh gS] ,rn~}kjk loZlk/kkj.k dh tkudkjh ds fy, 

izdkf'kr fd;k tkrk gSA  

 

               NÙkhlx<+ ds jkT;iky ds uke ls rFkk vkns'kkuqlkj] 

vfuy flUgk] mi&lfpo- 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

uok jk;iqj vVy uxj] fnukad 17 tuojh 2025 

 

Ø- 622@Mh- 03@21&v@izk:-@N-x-@25- & Hkkjr ds lafo/kku ds vuqPNsn 348 ds [k.M ¼3½ ds vuqlj.k 

esa NRrhlx<+ fo/kku lHkk lnL; osru] HkRrk rFkk isa'ku ¼la'kks/ku½ vf/kfu;e] 2024 ¼Øekad 2 lu~ 2025½ dk vaxzsth 

vuqokn jkT;iky ds izkf/kdkj ls ,rn~}kjk izdkf'kr fd;k tkrk gSA 

 

               NÙkhlx<+ ds jkT;iky ds uke ls rFkk vkns'kkuqlkj] 

vfuy flUgk] mi&lfpo- 

 

 

 

 



 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

 


	CG Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan Tatha Bhatta Adhiniyam, 1972, Act No 7 of 1973
	CG Vidhan Sabha Sadasya (Vetan, Bhatta Tatha Pension) (Sansodhan) Adhiniyam, 2002 Act No 17 of 2002
	CG Vidhan Sabha Sadasya, Vetan, Bhatta Tatha Pension, Sansodhan Adhiniyam, 2004 Act No 27 of 2004
	CG Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta Tatha Pension (Sansodhan) Adhiniyam, 2007 Act No 08 of 2007
	CG Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta Tatha Pension (Sansodhan) Adhiniyam, 2008, Act No 10 of 2008
	CG Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta Tatha Pension (Sansodhan) Adhiniyam, 2009, Act No 06 of 2009
	CG Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta Tatha Pension (Sansodhan) Adhiniyam, 2010, Act No 04 of 2010
	CG Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta Tatha Pension (Sansodhan) Adhiniyam, 2010, Act No 07 of 2010
	CG Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta Tatha Pension (Sansodhan) Adhiniyam, 2011, Act No 12 of 2011
	CG Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta Tatha Pension (Sansodhan) Adhiniyam, 2011, Act No 02 of 2012
	CG Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta Tatha Pension (Sansodhan) Adhiniyam, 2012, Act No 15 of 2012
	CG Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta Tatha Pension (Sansodhan) Adhiniyam, 2013, Act No 11 of 2013
	CG Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta Tatha Pension (Sansodhan) Adhiniyam, 2013, Act No 16 of 2013
	CG Vidhan Sabha Sadasya Vetan, Bhatta Tatha Pension (Sansodhan) Adhiniyam, 2016, Act No 17 of 2016

