Short

litle and
commence-
ment,

Amend- -
ment of
Act 650f
1980 im.1ts
applica-
tion to
Punjab-and
Chandis
garth,. L

Inser-

* tion of

new
section
14A.

Circam-
stances in
which
persons
may be )
detained
for
perieds
longer
than
three
months
without
obtaining
the
opinion
of
Advisory
Boards.

“’ﬁ%ﬁ“ﬁAﬁGNAL"’SECURm(‘*EAMENﬁr@EW'I j*ACTI 987

No. 27 ‘oF 1987

v [31st August, 1987.]

An Act further to amend the National Security Act, 1980, in its

application to the State of Punjab and the Union territory of
" Chandigarh:

1B it enacted by Parliament in the Thlrty-e1ghth Year of the Republic
of India as follows:—

wry (1y'Phis At may be called” the Nattonal’ Securlty (Amendment)
Act, 1987.

-(2)..1t, shall be deemed to have come into force on the ch day of

: June, 1987

. The National Security Act, 1980 (heremafter referred to as “the
pr1nc1pal Act) . shall, in. its. appllcatlon to. the State of Punjab and the

Union termtory of Chandlgarh have.effect subject to fthe amendments
specified in section 3. f

-3 In the prmmpal Act after sectmn 1& the followmg section shaﬂ
be mserted namely:— . .

‘14A (1) NotW1thstandmg anythmg contamed in the foregolng
prov1s10ns of this Act, or in any judgment, decree or order of any
court or other authorlty, any person in respect of whom: an order of

~ detention has been made under this Act at any time before the
~'8th day of J une, 1988 may- be detained without obtammg ‘the opinion
‘ot the Advisory Board for a period longer than three months, but not
exceeding six months, from the date of hig detention where such
person had been detained with a view to preventing him in any dis-
turbed area,—
(1) from interfering with the efforts of Government in coping
with the terrorist and disruptive activities; and '
(%) from acting in any manner prejudicial to—
(a) the defence of India; or
(b) the security of India; or
(c) the security of the Stafe; or'

(d) the maintenance of public order; or

1288



ace.27 0r 19871, National Security ((Amendmenty 28
 (e) the mamtenance of supphes and serV'lces essentlal
o to the commumty : e

, Ea:planatzon 1,~~The provisions of | ’che Exj)ldnatibn to -sub-section
(2) of section 3 shall apply for the purposes of this sub-sectmn as
they apply for the: purposes of that sub-section.’

Explanation 2—In this sub-section, “disturbed area” means any

~ ‘area which iy for the time being declared by notification under section

3 of 1983, 3 of the Punjab Disturbed Areas Act, 1983, or under section 3 of - the
33 of 1983, Chandigarh Disturbed Areas Act, 1983, to be a digturbed area. -

Eacplanatéon 3—In this sub-section. “terrorist and distruptive
activities” means “terrorist acts” and disruptive activities within
the meaning of the Terrorist and Disruptive Activities (Prevention)

Ord, 2 of Ordinance, 1987.
1987,

(2) In the case of any person to whom sub-section (I) applies,
sections 3, 8 and 10 to 14 shall have effect subject to the following
madifications, namely:—

{a) in section 3,—
(#) in sub-section (4), in the proviso—

(A) for the words “fen days”, the words = “fifteen
days” shall be substituted;

(B) for the words = “fifteen days”, the words ‘“‘twenty
days” shall be substituted;

(i) in sub-section (J), for the words “seven days”, the
words “fifteen days” shall be substituted;

(b) in section 8, in sub-section (1), for the words “ten days”,
the words “fifteen days” shall be substituted;

(¢) in section 10, for the words “shall within three wee
the words “shall, within four months and two weeks” shall be
substituted;

(d) in section 11,—

(#) in sub-section (1), for the words “seven weeks”, the
- words “five months' and three weeks” shall be substituted;

(i) in sub-section (2), for the words “detention of the
person concerned” the words “continued detention of the
person concerned” shall be substituted;

(e) in section 12, for the wbrds “for the detention”, - at both
the places where they occur, the words “for the continued deten-
tion” shall be substituted;-

(f) in section 13, for the words “twelve months”, the words
“two years” shall be substituted;

(9) in section 14, in the proviso to sub-section (2), for the
words “twelve months”, the words “two years” shall be substic
tuted.’,



20 Nabi¥hal Seitity (Amendmenty”  [acr 21 of 1087}

Repeals

Repeals
and
saving,

'4."The National Security (Amendment) Act, 1984, section 4 of the
National Security (Second Amendment) Act 1984 and " the National

- Security (Amendment) Act, 1985 are hereby repeal.ed

5. (1) The N atmnal Secunty (Amendment) Ordlnance 1987 s here-
by repealed. ,

(2) N otwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken

- under the principal Act as amended by the said "Ordinance, shall be

deemed to have been done or taken under the pr1nc1pal Act, as amended
by thls Act.

24 of 1984,
60 of 1984.
23 of 1985,

Ord. 3 of
1987.

1



